Tax Invoice

Signal Hill Products (Pty) Ltd

166 Gunners Circle Referonce No.: IN118181

Epping 1 Date: 09-May-2024

Cape Town, WC, 7460 Due Date: 30-Jun-2024

Phone: +27 (0) 21 203 2490 Customer |D: 179978

. Email: debtors@signalhillproducts.com Currency: ZAR

r} 16 N A ;l H | l !z M 0 B‘ ’ﬁ { ‘!—S Web: http://www.signalhillproducts.com Customer VAT # 4570295208
Source: LRFG09

BILL TO: SHIP TO:
" Signal Hill Products Africa - Duty Paid SHIP VIA:
166 Gunners Circle Signal Hill Products Africa - Duty Paid
Epping 1 166 Gunners Circle
Cape Town WC 7460 . Epping 1
SOUTH AFRICA Cape Town WC 7460
0212005818 SOUTH AFRICA
0212005818

CUSTOMER REF. NUMBER

onn55~ SMC Botswana (SG2006132) 30 days from Statement

SONUMBER ' : ~ CUSTOMERP.O.NO.
50108821 $5132029 ' PO000567- SMC Botswana (SG2006132)

Qry. UOM  UNIT PRICE DISC % DISCAMT  EXTENDED PRICE]
FG CD-048: Strongbow Red Berries Cider - 24 x 440ml  1,620.0000 CASE 208.4000 0% o o 337,608.00

CAN (4.5% ALC/VOL)
2 FG CD-052: Strongbow Gold Cider - 24 x 440m| CAN 1,080.0000 CASE 201.9600 0% 0.00 218,116.80
(4.5% ALC/VOL)
Driver: DPBC Packed By:
Cust Received By:
Driver Signature: DPBC Checked By:
Cust Signature
Truck Reg: Date:
Settlement Discount: R 0.00
E . . Sales Total: 555,724.80
Note : Please note settlement discount doesn't include returnable items.
Tax Total: 0.00
Total (ZAR): 555,724.80
Standard Bank --- Account name: Signal Hill Products (Pty) Ltd - Account number: 000895466 -— Branch code: 000205
Company Reg: 2013/035584/07 --- Company VAT: 4460259833 -— Customs Code: 21127081
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Alice Mashile

D ———— e S e e I e Smanciiie |
From: George Beeslaar <george.beeslaar@signalhillproducts.com>
Sent: Thursday, 09 May 2024 15:28
To: Alice Mashile; Tiaan Barnardo; Dean Ammasai; Raphael Malepe
Subject: RE: Export collection

Hi all,

The truck is at your premises.
ATS Transport

Driver: Temba Gumbi

Reg: CFM37374
CELL:0717386047

Please do not give the invoice to the driver. | will email the necessary paperwork.
Best regards,
George Beeslaar

Contracts and Exports Controller
084 332 0682

SIGNAL HILL PRC

A 0\31 B _AF'Q/C
Neuils Peak I

George Beeslaar
Contracts & Exports Controller
+27 84 332 0628



SIGNAL HILL PRODUCTS

§ g <H Arg,
Deuils Peal e
BEER COMPANY ﬂ'

From: Alice Mashile <alice@Irsa.co.za>

Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2024 12:36 PM

To: George Beeslaar <george.beeslaar@signalhillproducts.com>; Tiaan Barnardo <tiaan@Irsa.co.za>; Dean Ammasai
<dean@Irsa.co.za>; Raphael Malepe <raphael@Irsa.co.za>

Subject: RE: Export collection

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Perfect, thank you!

From: George Beeslaar <george.beeslaar@signalhiliproducts.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2024 12:32 PM

To: Alice Mashile <alice@®|rsa.co.za>; Tiaan Barnardo <tiaan@Irsa.co.za>; Dean Ammasai <dean@lrsa.co.za>; Raphael
Malepe <raphael@irsa.co.za>

Subject: RE: Export collection

Hi Alice,

| fixed it, you will find it now.

Best regards,

George Beeslaar
Contracts and Exports Controller
084 332 0682



SIGNAL HILL PRC

°°1H 'AFQIO
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George Beeslaar
Contracts & Exports Controller
+27 84 332 0628

From: Alice Mashile <alice@|rsa.co.za>

Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2024 12:22 PM

To: George Beeslaar <george.beesiaar@signathillproducts.com>; Tiaan Barnardo <tiaan@Ilrsa.co.za>; Dean Ammasai
<dean@Irsa.co.za>; Raphael Malepe <raphael@I|rsa.co.za>

Subject: RE: Export collection

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Afternoon George

Please see below | need to pull Import sheet on ShipmentDetail



z m 0 Q ShipmentDetail _LR
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From: George Beeslaar <george.heeslaar@signalhillproducts.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2024 11:15 AM

To: Tiaan Barnardo <tiaan@Irsa.co.za>; Dean Ammasai <dean@|rsa.co.za>; Raphael Malepe <raphael@Irsa.co.za>; Alice

Mashile <alice@Irsa.co.za>
Subject: Export collection

Hi all,

ATS transport will collect 30 pallets of Strongbow cans this afternoon.

Shipment: SS132029

I will send the truck details shortly.




" George Beeslaar
Contracts & Exports Controller
+27 84 332 0628

SIGNAL HILL PRODUCTS

RECR COHPANY

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature.
If you are not the intended recipient, you may not peruse, use, disseminate, distribute or copy this
message or file which is attached to this message. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately by e-mail, facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the
original message. Any views of this communication are those of the sender except where the sender
specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa with Registered Office at 254 OR
Tambo Drive, Hamilton, Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please note that the recipient must scan
this e-mail and any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible to protect information
from viruses, we do not accept any liability of whatever nature for any loss, damage or expense resulting
directly orindirectly from the access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail
message.
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