Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd

= Physical Address 215 Main Street, Paarl, South Africa, 7646
w o dl .q F m F o Q — A Postal Address PO Box 7198, Paarl North, South Africa, 7646 0> z v> m—
Telephone 0861 744 447 / 021 870 1130 m moc v
HOLDIN G S VAT No 4910289216
Registration No 2016/124261/07 CAMPARI SOUTH AFRICA
Liquor License NLA 10360
. . " TAX INVOICE )
Blue Bottle Liquor The Grapevine (Robertson) Robertson Liquors
Delivery Address: Postal Address: Account Number  GRA210
58 Barry Street P O. Box 788 VAT Number 4430147092
Robertson Robertson Transaction Date  10/10/2024
6705 6705 External Order Tyron
Invoice Number IN135139
ﬁmmu Name Tyron Cairncross )
Code ltem Description Warehouse Name QTY Packaging Price (Ex) Price(In) Disc% Nett Total (Excl) Tax Nett Total (Incl)
427038  Bisquit & Dubouche VS Liquor Runners GEO 1.0 Case 06 x 750 2837.59 326323 10.0% 2553.83 383.07 2936.90
N
IIIMJ//-/ /
U / LIQUOR RUNNERS GECRGE
Wy
™~ S
Receivedby _ . _ . _ .. .._ \WPZ—A_ZQ DETAILS: N Total (Excl) ZAR 2 553.83
Date i Account Name  Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd Tax 15.00 % 383.07
Bank Name Standard Bank Total (Incl) ZAR 2936.90
Bank Account 272 549 541 Discount 0.00
) Branch Code 051 001
Signed i _Payment Ref GRA210 IN135139 p Total (Incl) ZAR 2936.90

n (Registered to The Wine Call Center (Pty) Ltd)

10/10/2024 2:00:14 PM



Abbatoir Road Abbatoir Road
George Industria George Industria
George g George
L Liguor Kumers

044 874 3246 044 874 3241

Jeremy@lrsa.co.za Liquor Runner  George Http: / /www.lrsa.co.za

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR20420815 2024-10-11 08:20:22

LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID , DATE Delivered -
Reg. No. Truck Description  Load Capacity Driver Name Dispatcher Checker

Reason for Credit: Cancelled by Principal : :
Customer Name: Grapevine Liquors

Brief Description of Credit:

Principal Customer Code: GRA210

Doc. Date: 2024-10-10 Doc. Ref: IN135139CAM GRV: Credit Type: Credit Invoice Amt: R 2936.9

Stock Code Stock Description Unit Packsize Reason Code Reason Batch QTyY
CAM427038 Bisquit & Dubouche VS cs Case 06 x 750 P1 Cancelled by Princip 1
Total Number of Items to be credited on Decument Ref: IN135139CAM (1 Product Type) 1

Authorized by: L

[date]




BOTTLE LOGIC

Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd

Physical Address 215 Main Street, Paarl, South Africa, 7646
PO Box 7198, Paarl North, South Africa, 7646

Postal Address

CAMPARI

GROUP

Telephone 0861 744 447 / 021 870 1130 CAMPARI SOUTH AERICA
H OLDIN ﬁu S VAT No 4910289216
Registration No 2016/124261/07
Liquor License NLA 10360 \ Credit Note \
. . ] Account Number GRA210
Blue Bottle Liquor The Grapevine (Robertson) Robertson Liquors VAT Number 4430147092
Delivery Address: Postal Address: Transaction Date 11/10/2024
58 Barry Street P.O. Box 788 Credit Note No CR7688
mmw%m rison mwwmm:mos Linked Invoice No  IN135139
External Order Tyron
/ Credit Reason Correction-Reinvoice \
Code Item Description Warehouse Name QTY Packaging Price (In) Disc % Nett Total (Excl) Tax Nett Total (Incl
427038 Bisquit & Dubouche VS Liquor Runners GEO 1.0 Case 06 x 750 ml 2 936.91 0.0% 2553.83 383.07 2936.90
Wrong warehouse.
Received b g N Total (Excl 2 553.
Y BANKING DETAILS: T e A
o,
Date A —— Account Name _ Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd ax 15.00 % 383.07
Bank Name Standard Bank Total (Incl) 2 936.90
Bank Account 272 549 541 Discount 0.00
. Branch Code 051 001
Signed . frvmwamsﬂ Ref GRA210  CR7688 Total (Incl) 2936.90
o

Sage 200 Evolution (Registered to The Wine Call Center (Pty) Ltd)

11/10/2024 8:15:00 AM



Jurica Luiters

———
From: Jurica Luiters
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 08:19
To: Sanel Steyn; Michaela Pedder
Subject: RE: IN135139(GRA210)(Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd)(2024-10-10)

Baie dankie Sanel

Mooi dag verder

Kind Regards
Jurica Van Heerden

office 044 0100070
email georgeorders@lrsa.co.za

1 Abattior Road, George Industria, George, 6530

L Liquor Kumers

From: Sanel Steyn <debtorsl@liquorgistics.co.za>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 08:16

To: Jurica Luiters <georgeorders@lrsa.co.za>; Michaela Pedder <orders@liquorgistics.co.za>
Subject: RE: IN135139(GRA210)(Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd)(2024-10-10)

Hi Jurica

Vind krediet nota aangeheg.
Dankie.

Kind Regards / Vriendelike Groete
SANEL STEYN

LIQUORGISTICS

SUD-SAHARAN AFRICA

YOUR BUSINESS SOLUTION

debtorsi@liquorgistics.co.za
021-870 1130 | Ext. 214
215 Main Street, Paarl, WC
www.liguorgistics.co.za

& @ & 4

From: Jurica Luiters <georgeorders@Iirsa.co.za>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 08:09
To: Michaela Pedder <orders@liquorgistics.co.za>; Sanel Steyn <debtorsl@liquorgistics.co.za>
Subject: RE: IN135139(GRA210)(Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd)(2024-10-10)

1



Good morning, Michaela

Hope you well.
Please note the attached Invoice was printed on the wrong plant.
@SANEL please forward me the credit .

Kind Regards
Jurica Van Heerden

office 044 010 0070
email georgeorders@Irsa.co.za

1 Abattior Road, George Industria, George, 6530

From: Michaela Pedder <orders@liquorgistics.co.za>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 14:01

To: Jurica Luiters <georgeorders@Irsa.co.za>

Subject: IN135139(GRA210)(Bottle Logic Holdings (Pty) Ltd)(2024-10-10)

Good day,
Please find invoice attached for delivery.

Kind regards,
Michaela Pedder
Liguorgistics
0218701130

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature. If you are
not the intended recipient, you may not peruse, use, disseminate, distribute or copy this message or file which is
attached to this message. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail,
facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the original message. Any views of this communication
are those of the sender except where the sender specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa
with Registered Office at 254 OR Tambo Drive, Hamilton, Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please note that
the recipient must scan this e-mail and any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible to protect

information from viruses, we do not accept any liability of whatever nature for any loss, damage or expense
resulting directly or indirectly from the access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail
message.



