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Pernod Ricard -
South Africa . | -
Building &, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive e ' i a m _.
Woodmead, Sandtan, GAUTENG, 2191 ' .‘ _
Phone: D11 802 D600 Fax: 011 BO2 0620 ' aai |
et ot Tax Invoice
Vat No: 4670144973
Buyer: Consignee: Doc Ng: 1545799
Supply Chain PRSA Supply Chain PRSA Date: 2025-03-18
0 : Customer: 902
Branch / Plant: SDGE
Warehouse LL: RG/0002813
Order No: 4423 58
Liquor License;
Buyer's VAT:
; 30 Days from
Requested Date; 2025-03-18 Customer PO: Ultra Knysna - TGL 15v0 Currency: ZAR Payment Term; statement
Item number Description UoM Qty Unit Selling Price Discount VAT Total Amount
160550 The Glenlivet 15YO French Oak 6x750mi 43% .0000 EA 1.00 0.00 0.00
Total VAT Total Including
0.00
COD Total
Banking Details Received in good order on behalf of customer
Account No: 0201556023 Signature:
Branch SOUTH AFRICA Date:
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Pernod Ricard South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate GAUTENG ZA 2191
Phone: +264 411 802 0600 Fax: +264 D11 802 0500
Reg No: 1904/004225/07
Vat No: 4670144973

STOCK CLAIMS

DOC NO: - 215914
BUYER: Liquar City {(Knysna) (EFT 24hrs) CONSIGNEE: Liquor City (Knysna) (EFT 24hrs) Date - 2025/03/18
23 Nelson Street 23 Nelson Street Customer - 7197
Brn/Pit - SDGE
Related P.O, -
Knysna Knysna QOrder Nbr - 150832 CO
6571 6571 Cuirency - ZAR
Page -1
Vessel: Vat. No,
Container ID;
Shipping Terms; 200 Low
Request Date Customer P.Q,
2025/03/18 Ross
Ln Description item Lot UCM Shipped Unit Price uom Qty Velume({l) Volume (M3} Net Weight Total
Number Number Pricing Pallets Amount
1.000 The Glenlivet 15YC French Oak 6x750ml 160550 EA -1.00 852.3500 EA -0 -0.75 -0.0028 -1.33 -85235
43%
-1.00 8523500 -0 0.75 -0.0028 -1.33 -852.35
Terms EFT 24hrs after delivery 2.0% Net Due 2025/03/19 Tax Rate 15% Sales Tax -127.85  Total Order -880.20
Date

UCR Reference;
Bank: Citibank ZAR
Account No / Branch: 0201556023 / SOUTH AFRICA

I

2025/03/18 11:31:52
UserlD: SCETO
R56SA001 ZA43000014



_<=m:o: Mlando

From: Shamonley De Waal <shamonley.dewaal@pernod-ricard.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 March 2025 13:00

To: Mignon Mlando

Subject: FW: Liquor City Knysna

Attachments: CO 150632 .pdf

Hi Mignon.

Please keep this on your records.

Please print the below S8 to get this hottle out of your system.

Customer Service Inquiry  Additional Selections

ﬁ‘H

Order Number 4423 58 P Branch/Plant

Customer PO ¥

Iterst Number *

Sold To z () Extend Back Order Quantity

Ship To ) (C] Customer ltem
Records -2 Shamn

| |

DEG. WL WL Y 0T Ml swe  jwm — ity v
] % 520 540 4423 58 00430 1.000 902 Supply Chain PRSA The Glenlivet 15Y0 French ... 1.0000 EA
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‘Shamonley De Waal
Regional Qutbound Specialist: Coastal | Pernod Ricard South Africa

From: Ross Bennett <ross.bennett@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Monday, March 17, 2025 10:24 AM

To: liquorcityknysna@gmail.com; Shamonley De Waal <sha monley.dewaal@pernod-ricard.com>
Cc: Tyrone Young <tyrone.young@pernod-ricard.com>

Subject: RE: Liquor City Knysna

Hi Riaan
The credit was passed.
@Shamonley De Waal, please could you send the credit not so the client can take this bottle off his system.

Regards

Ross Bennett
Sales Manager Southern Cape Hybrid | Pernod Ricard South Africa

From: liquorcityknysna@gmail.com <liguorcityknysna@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 17, 2025 10:09 AM

To: Ross Bennett <ross.bennett@pernod-ricard.com>

Subject: Liquor City Knysna

Importance: High

ot click links or open attachments unless you trust the sender and know the

[WARNING] Beware of Phishing - This is an external email. Do n

content is safe.

Hi Ross

Trust you are well;

I want to hear if you can help me get the problem resolved of the Glenlivet 15yo. I had a customer in the shop that was
complaining about the quality of a bottle that he bought from us but had no slip, I phoned Tyron first and asked if Perno was
willing to replace the bottle and I was given the go-ahead to do so. Tyron collected the bottle and was never replaced. This
happened in early January and I'm still waiting for my replacement bottle.



