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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

I

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive s |
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191 _
Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620 | L,
e
Reg No: 1994/004226/07
Vat No: 4670144973
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Ngdoile b collect

1446893
2023-09-27
901

KZND
Ref:1725
1842753

Buyer's VAT:

30 days from
statement

2023-09-27 30701XR-KZNDspartradeshow

B

Item number

162100 Absolut Berry Vodkarita 6x(4x300ml) 6% .0000 CA 30.00 584.54 0.00 17,536.20
162101 Absolut Passionfruit Martini 6x{4x300ml) 6% .0000 CA 30.00 584.54 0.00 17,536.20
162102 Malibu Strawberry Daiquiri 6x(4x300ml} 5% .0000 CA 30.00 550.31 0.00 16,509.30
162103 Malibu Pina Colada 5% 6x(4x300ml) .0000 CA 30.00 550.31 0.00 16,509.30

ding. |
68,091.00
68,091.00

1
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LRSA VARIANCE REPORT FOR SINGLE INVOICE 9169392
PERNOD STAFF ORDER TO RECEIVE 0 PALLETS PRI1446899
Scanned St Code St Desc PackSize Unit Units QTY Scan QTY Variance*
27/09/2023 03:06 162100 Absolut Berry VYodkaritaéx(4x300ml) 6% 1 CA 30 30 0
27/09/2023 03:06 162101 Absolut Passionfruit Martiniéx(4x300mi) 6% 1 CA 30 30 0
27/09/2023 03:06 162102 Malibu Strawberry Daiquiriéx{4x300ml) 5% 1 CA 30 30 0
27/09/2023 03:06 162103 Malibu Pina Colada 5%6x{4x300ml) 1 CA 30 30 0
120.00 120.00 0.00

Sbesise 11

Wednesday 27 September 20




LRSA SINGLE PICK FOR COLLECTION / &t

PRSASTAFF ~ PRI1446899
Stock Code Stock Description Packsize Unit Batch Units QTY
Load ID: 9169392
Pernod Ricard South Africa
PERNOD STAFF ORDER
CA
162100 Absolut Berry Vodkaritaéx(4x300ml) 6% 1 _ CA @W\
162101 Absolut Passionfruit Martiniéx{4x300ml) 6% 1 _ CA @
162103 Malibu Pina Colada 5%6x(4x300ml) | o . CA 60
162102 Malibu Strawberry Daiquiriéx(4x300ml) 5% 1 CA @

: 120
Naobile o collec
Picked By: \/\Q&\sxc\ Checked By. "Ohus, @

2023/09/27 13:38:20
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Priscilla Ramlall

TSI

From: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 September 2023 12:24

To: Sam Pillay; Ngobile Zama; SSA - SA - Group Debtors; Priscilla Ramlall; Wikus Vermeulen; Kobus Claassens
Cc: Julia Ngwenya; Gloria Kok; Brandon Pillay; Andrew Morris; Claire Walsh; Yvonne Pillay

Subject: RE: Spar KZN Promo Stock - Memo Approvals Required

Attachments: PRSA MEMO Ngabile Zama.docx; PRSA MEMQ Ngobile Zama.docx

Approved

Pranishwar Maharaj

Accounts Receivable Manager | Pernod Ricard South Africa
My waorking hours moy be different frem yours so piease do not feel obliged to reply outside your normal working hours

From: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 10:52 AM

To: Ngobile Zama <ngobile.zama@pernod-ricard.com>; Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>; SSA - SA - Group Debtors
<GroupDebtors@pernod-ricard.com>; Priscilla <priscilla@Irsa.co.za>; wikus@Irsa.co.za; 'Kobus Claassens' <kobus@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Julia Ngwenya <Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>; Gloria Kok <gloria.kok@pernod-ricard.com>; Brandon Pillay <Brandon.Pillay@pernod-

ricard.com>; Andrew Morris <Andrew.Morris@pernod-ricard.com>; Claire Walsh <Claire.C.Walsh@pernod-ricard.com>
Subject: FW: Spar KZN Promo Stock - Memo Approvals Required

Good Morning @Pranishwar §mrmwmw
Trust you well
Please find memo’s attached and kindly approve

.@__Aomcmn_mmwwmam., @zgsm_m.NmEm will be collecting the below stock at 2pm today, kindly process a QR code for his access:

Name: Ngobile Zama
ID No: 9602145422089
Cell No: 067 415 2007

Vehicle Reg:  NUR 22967

Thanks so much



Warm regards
Sam Pillay

Sales Coordinator East Coast | Pernod Ricard South Africa

My warking hours muoy be et from yours so please do not feel obliged to reply outside your normal working howrs

From: Priscilla Ramlall <priscilla@Irsa.co.za>

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 10:36 AM

To: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@ pernod-ricard.com>; Julia Ngwenya <Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>; Gloria Kok <gloria.kok@pernod-ricard.com>; Claire
Walsh <Claire.C.Walsh@pernod-ricard.com>; Wikus Vermeulen <wikus@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Brandon Pillay <Brandon.Pillay@pernod-ricard.com>; Andrew Morris <Andrew.Morris@pernod-ricard.com>

Subject: RE: Spar KZN Promo Stock

[WARNING] Beware of Phishing = This is an external email, Do not click links or open attachments Unless you trust the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Sam

Collection can be done after 2.00pm

Kind Regards,

Priscilla Ramilall

office 0317054986
email  priscilla@lrsa.co.za

30 Hillclimb Road, Westmead, 3610

= Ligquor Rumers

From: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 10:27 AM

To: Julia Ngwenya <Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>; Gloria Kok <gloria.kok@pernod-ricard.com>; Claire Walsh <Claire.C.Walsh@pernod-ricard.com>;
Wikus Vermeulen <wikus@]rsa.co.za>; Priscilla Ramlall <priscilla@Irsa.co.za>




Cc: Brandon Pillay <Brandon.Pillay@pernod-ricard.com>; Andrew Morris <Andrew.Morris@pernod-ricard.com>
Subject: RE: Spar KZN Promo Stock

Thanks Juls,
Kindly advise order amount in order to process memo.

@Claire Walsh, just confirming Ngobile will assist with this order?
@wikus@Irsa.co.za and @Priscilla please advise collection time today for the below order

Warm regards

Sam Pillay

Sales Coordinator East Coast | Pernod Ricard South Africa
My working hours may be different front yours so pleose de not feel obliged to reply outside your norenal working hours

From: Julia Ngwenya <Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 10:24 AM

To: Gloria Kok <gloria.kok@pernod-ricard.com>; Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>
Subject: RE: Spar KZN Promo Stock

On CR

Crder Number 18427 53 : 00430 BranchiPiant -~ KZND

Sold To IS [ Mational Sales Department Order Date 09/27/2023

Ship To 501 e Mational Sales Depariment Cust PO 30701XR-KZNDspartradesh

Currency ZAR Exchange Rate : - : Base ZAR I Forenn

ecords 1-5 .

= ltem Quantity . Secondary ' Secondary  Ln s Unit
-1 Number Ordered Uok Auantity Uol Ty  Description 1 Price
3 162100 30.0000 CA 180.0000 EA S Absolut Berry Vodkarita

3 162101 30.0000 CA 180.0000 EA S Absclut Passicnfruit Martini

) 162102 30.0000 CA 180.0000 EA S Malibu Strawberry Daiquiri

N 162103 30.0000 CA 180.0000 EA S Malibu Pina Colada 5%

w

584.5400
584.5400
550.3100

550.5100

Extended
Price

17,536.20
17,536.20
16,509.30

16,509,350

. Branch/
- Plant

KZND
KZND
KZND
KZND



Julia Ngwenya
Customer Service Agent

from yours so please do not feel ok Lo reply outside

From: Gloria Kok <gloria.kok@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 10:18 AM

To: Julia Ngwenya <Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>
Subject: Spar KZN Promo Stock

@ 30701 XR 00430

e

KZMND-5par Trade Show

i normal werking hours

S

4 Requisition Detail

. Reviewapprovals  Add New Requisition

Records 1-4
=l & e =
_r_ - Description - Quantity LJOM
@ & ZOF-Malibu Strawberry Daiquiri 30,0000 CA
_HU Z0F-Malibu Pina Colada 5% 20,0000 Ca
O 252-Absolut Passionfruit Hart 30,0600 CA
(T Z52-Absalut Berry Vodkarita 30.0000 CA
L2 Gloria Kok
ﬁ ] Key Accounts Coordinator Qff Trade | Pernod Ricard South Africa
Pernod Ricard
Crécdeeers de ¢ omwvialitd HMW MHHHWMWMMQ
- 21, Woodlands Drive, Country Club Estate Woodmeaod, Building 6
@ @ o - 2191 Johannesburg - South Africa

IR55

68,091,00 SUBMITTED

| Extended

. Price

Commaedity

16,509,30 £5241.Ka70051
15,509,320 C5241.KA70051
17,536.20 C5241,KAT0051

17,536.20 £5241.KA70051

09/25/20

Line
Stalus

ORDERED
ORDERED
ORDERED

ORDERED
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ing hours may be different from yours 8o please do not fee!

ing howrs

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not
peruse, use, disseminate, distribute or copy this message or file which is attached to this message. If you have received this message in error, please notify the
sender immediately by e-mail, facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the original message. Any views of this communication are those of
the sender except where the sender specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa with Registered Office at 254 OR Tambo Drive, Hamilton,
Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please note that the recipient must scan this e-mail and any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible
to protect information from viruses, we do not accept any liability of whatever nature for any loss, damage or expense resulting directly or indirectly from the
access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail message.



