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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191

Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

Reg No: 1994/004226/07

Raam Harichunder Jairam
w:_v & Anchor BBL (1KZ020) (EFT OD)

38 Agra Crescent

Ladysmith 3370

2023-09-08

250531 Olmeca Reposado 12x750ml 35% 12.7500

Bank: ABSA
Account No: *EEXXXT386
Branch 632005
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Notice of Payment 18 September 2023

Dear SHIP AND ANCHOR (PTY) LTD
Subject: Notice Of Payment: Pernod Ricard SA

Please be advised that you made a payment to Pernod Ricard SA as indicated below.
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Transaction number; - ¢ 5o S et - 8075892213-7

Payment date: 2023-09-18
Payment made from: SHIP%ANCHR PTY
Payment made to: Pernod Ricard SA
Beneficiary bank name: ABSA BANK
Beneficiary account number: 4079327386

Bank branch code: 632005

For the amount of: 17 395.42
Immediate interbank payment: N

Reference on beneficiary statement: 57733

Please remember that the following applies to online banking payments to non-ABSA and Absa Vehicle and
Asset Finance bank accounts.

+  Payments made on weekdays before 15:30 will be credited to the receiving bank account by midnight of
the same day.

+  Payments made on weekdays after 15:30 will be credited by midnight of the following day.

«  Payments made on a Saturday, Sunday or Public holiday will be credited to the account by midnight of the
1st following weekday.
Payments may take up to 30 minutes to reflect in the beneficiary's Vehicle Finance Account.

If you need more information or assistance, please call us on 0860 008 600 or +2711 501 5110
(International calls).

If you have made an incorrect internet banking payment, please send an email to digital@absa.co.za

Yours sincerely
General Manager: Digital Channels

This document is intended for use by the addressee and is privileged and confidential. If the transmission
has been misdirected to you, please contact us immediately. Thank you.

| +  Payrnts made on.weekdays after 15:30 will be credited by midnight of the following day. .

Absa Bank Limited Reg No 1986/004794/06 Authorised Financial Services and Registered Credit Provider Reg No NCRCP7 Company Information:
www.absa.co.za



Priscilla Ramlall
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From: Yashnavi Devar <yashnavi.devar@pernod-ricard.com>
Sent: Thursday, 28 September 2023 14:48
To: Wikus Vermeulen; SSA - SA - Group Debtors
Cc: shamonley.dewaal@pernod-ricard.com; Priscilla Ramlall; Selwyn Kok
Subject: RE: Short Payment Ship and Anchor 57733

Good day
The customer has credit on the account of R8 779.79
Kind Regards

Yashnavi Devar
Accounts Receivable Clerk | Pernod Ricard South Africa
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From: Wikus Vermeulen <wikus@Irsa.co.za>
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2023 2:08 PM

To: SSA - SA - Group Debtors <GroupDebtors@pernod-ricard.com>
Cc: Shamonley De Waal <Shamonley.DeWaal@pernod-ricard.com>; Priscilla Ramlall <priscilla@]Irsa.co.za>; Selwyn Kok <selwyn@Irsa.co.za>
Subject: FW: Short Payment Ship and Anchor 57733

Hi All

Piease see attached invoices and proof of payment.

Invoices amount payable 17841.46 (R11444826 and RI1444839)

Customer paid 17395.42, short paid 446.04. Please advise if customer has credit due.
Kind Regards

Wikus Vermeulen
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mobile 082 6602619
email dbn@lrsa.co.za

30 Hillclimb Road, Westmead, 3610

From: scan®@librawms.online <scan@Ilibrawms.online>
Sent: Friday, September 22,2023 9:01 AM

To: Wikus Vermeulen <wikus@lrsa,co.za>

Subject:

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not
peruse, use, disseminate, distribute or copy this message or file which is attached to this message. If you have received this message in error, please notify the
sender immediately by e-mail, facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the original message. Any views of this communication are those of
the sender except where the sender specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa with Registered Office at 254 OR Tambo Drive, Hamilton,
Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please note that the recipient must scan this e-mail and any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible
to protect information from viruses, we do not accept any liability of whatever nature for any loss, damage or expense resulting directly or indirectly from the
access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail message.



