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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191

Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

‘Reg No: 1994/004226/07 ] T i il Tax Invoice
Vat No: 4670144973

Buyer: i Consignee: . DocNo: 1461783

_nEmN:E.Zmﬂm_ .OJ Con _A?wwc_.c Zm.ﬁm_,om_.nﬂ.....: Umam" : | 2023-12-08

g 0 Customer: 907
w..m:&.. / Plant: ..H KZND
Warehouse LL: ~ Ref: 1725
OrderNo: 1934653
.E.._.._.nq _..m....bm:.mn"“_ e

Buyer's VAT:

Requested Date:  2023-12-07 Customer PO: 26510 XO KZND Pencil Club Currency: AR Payment Term: wm_ Mﬁﬂﬂa
R T B
300103 Luc Belaire Gold 6x750ml 12.5% 440.8200 EA 6.00 440.82 -440.82
300101 Luc Belaire Rose 6x750ml 12.5% 440.8200 EA 6.00 440.82 -440.82
300102 Luc Belaire Luxe 6x750ml 12.5% 440.8200 EA 6.00 440.82 -440.82
300105 Luc Belaire Bleu 6x750ml 12.5% 440.8200 EA 6,00 440,82 -440.82
300104 Luc Belaire Luxe Rose 6x750ml 12.5% 440.8200 , EA 6.00 440,82 -440.82

. BankingDetails _ Recaivedin good order on behalf of customer

Account No: kEAAEXTIB6 Signature: k/

Branch 632005 Date: \\/«\ ) Om .‘P

Page 1 of 1 ZED AQQ@&




LRSA SINGLE PICK FOR COLLECTION / SPEC
PROMO PRI1461783
Stock Code Stock Description Packsize Unit Batch Units QTY
Load ID: 9187515
Pernod Ricard South Africa
PROMOSIE
EA

300105 Luc Belaire Bleu6x750ml 12.5% 1 EA 6 —

300103 Luc Belaire Gold6x750ml 12.5% 1 EA 6~

300104 Luc Belaire Luxe Roseéx750mt 12.5% 1 EA 6—

300102 Luc Belaire Luxe6x750ml 12.5% 1 EA 6 —

300101 Luc Belaire Rose6x750ml 12.5% 1 EA 6 —
30

Chivere | cellect

/.

Picked By: Z%é\ Checked By:

2023/12/08 08:36:20
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Wikus Vermeulen
[~

i s
From: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>
Sent: Thursday, 07 December 2023 15:30
To: Sam Pillay; Wikus Vermeulen; Priscilla Ramlall; Kobus Claassens
Cc: Chimone Horst; Nomzamo Dlomo; Neo Phori
Subject: RE: The Pencil Club - Memo Approval Required
Attachments: X0 26509 Then Pencil Club.pdf; XO 26510 The Pencil Club.pdf; PRSA MEMO Chimone Horst.docx
Approved

Pranishwar Maharaj
Accounts Receivable Mana

My wort DS TG D

ger | Pernod Ricard South Africa

e Lo repd of working frours

3O 4o not feel ob de your

1 yOurs

From: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2023 3:28 PM
To: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>; wikus@Irsa.co.za; Priscilla <priscilla@Irsa.co.za>; 'Kobus Claassens' <kobus®@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Chimone Horst <chimone.horst@pernod-ricard.com>; Nomzamo Dlomo <nomzamo.dlomo@pernod-ricard.com>
Subject: The Pencil Club - Memo Approval Required

Good Afternoon Everyone,
@Pranishwar Maharaj, kindly approve memo attached for collection tomorrow

@wikus@Irsa.co.za, please advise suitable collection time
@'Kobus Claassens', please create a QR code for Chimone, details below:

Name: Chimone Horst
Cell: 060962 2436
ID: 9310050068083

Vehicle Reg: NUR 78069

Thanks so much

Warm regards



