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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Waocdlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2151

Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

Reg No: 1994/004226/07

Vat No: 4670144973 .

Buyer: e
Promo Stock - Human Resources 2800
0

Requested Date:  2023-11-27 Customer PO:

Item number Description:

161104 Inverroche Gin Amber 6x750ml 43% 399.6300
Banking _u..mz_.m_m. .

Bank: ABSA

Account No: REREEEII86

Branch 632005

Page 1 of 1

Tax Invoice

Doc No:

Consignee: 1462760
Promo Stock - Human Resources 2800 Date: : 2023-12-12
o Customer: 66682
Branch \.Emsﬂ. KZND
Warehouse LL: Ref: 1725
Order No: 147955
Liquor License:
Buyer's VAT:
26145 XO KZND Christmas G Currency: ZAR Payment Term: 30ty o
i gy ; statement
UoM . L . .0,2 c:: m.m_:nm mw:n.m Discount <.5. Total Amount
EA 20.00 399.63 -399.63
Total VAT . Total Including
0.00
COD Total
* Received in muon._.o._dma @: ,».mrm:“ of customer
Name:
Signature:
Date: \@N\?w\ 20%s

(Pl CH o’
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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191

Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

Reg No: 1994/004226/07

Vat No: 4670144973 ..

Buyer:

Promo m.nonr.p _.E:._m_._ Resources 2800

0

Requested Date:

Item number

161104

Bank:
Account No:

Branch

Page 1 of 1

2023-11-27 Customer PO:

‘Description

Inverroche Gin Amber 6x750ml 43% 399.6300

: ,.mmzaam nmﬁ&_.m

ABSA
kkkEkRTIQL
632005

akinveices

Consignee:
Promo Stock - Human Resources 2800
4]

Buyer's VAT:

26145 XO KZND Christmas G

UoM_

EA

Signature:

Doc No: | 1462760
Date: | 2023-12-12
Customer: . 66682
Branch / Plant: KZND
Warehouse LL: Ref:1725
Order No: 1479 55
Liquor License:
i : ,n. 30 days from
Currency: ZAR vmximzﬁ._.w...i. a—
Qty  UnitSelling Price ~ Discount <>._. : ._..omm._ Amount
20.00 399.63 -399.63
Total VAT - Total Including
0.00
COoD Total

- m.mn.m_.qmm in m.oma .n.:im... on behalf of ncﬂo_._,_nm

Date:
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Pernod Ricar

0,

south Africa

MEMORANDUM ~ PERMISSION TO COLLECT GOODS

Date 11" December 2023
Requested by Sam Pillay
Warehouse KZND

Customer name Staff Gifting
Customer numher 66682

Invoice number | S5 1479 and 1480
Total amount of goods to be collected R6,618.33

Reason for collection

To whom it may concern

I hereby grant Wiseman Maphanga to act as a company representative to collect the goods listed
above from the warehouse on this day 12" December 2023.

Furthermore, kindly ensure that the sales representative returns

the following:

e Signed POD

Should the sales representative have any POD’s or unpaid COD/Cash outstanding — DO NOT
ALLOW THE COLLECTION?

Kindly note any order more than R50 000.00 cannot be collected by the sales representative due
to good-in-transit insurance coverage.

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at 011 802 0600 at
your earliest convenience.

Kind Regards

X

Riva Harichunder
Finance Manager

PERNOQD RICARD SOUTH AFRICA (Pty) Ltd. Reg No. 1994/004226/07
Building 6, Country Club Eslate, 21 Woodiands Drive, Woodmead, Sandton, Gauteng, 2191. Postal: PO Box 4292. Halfway House. 1685
Phene: +27 (0)11 802 0600, Fax: +27 (0)11 802-0620
Directors: GPM Leymarie*, G. Morin*, SS Maharaj

*Fiench



Wikus Vermeulen

B e e i P e i e O e T s ST 2L R A P =P et ;
From: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 December 2023 15:34

To: Sam Pillay; Wikus Vermeulen; Kobus Claassens

Cc: Celeste Carstens; Priscilla Ramlall; Dudu Mbele; Selwyn Kok; Wiseman Maphanga; Claire Walsh; Lesley Moonsamy

Subject: RE: S5 1479 & 1480 - Collection 12.10.23 Memo Approval Required

Attachments: PRSA MEMO WM.docx; KZND Christmas 23 15.pdf; KZND Christmas 23 16.pdf

Approved

Pranishwar Maharaj
Accounts Receivable Manager | Pernod Ricard South Africa

Ay working hours may be different from yours so please do not feel obiiged to reply e vour normal working hours

From: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 2:04 PM

To: wikus@Irsa.co.za; Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>; 'Kobus Claassens' <kobus@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Celeste Carstens <Celeste.Carstens@pernod-ricard.com>; Priscilla <priscilla@Irsa.co.za>; Dudu Mbele <dudu@Irsa.co.za>; selwyn@Irsa.co.za; Wiseman Maphanga
<wiseman.maphanga@pernod-ricard.com>; Claire Walsh <Claire.C.Walsh@pernod-ricard.com>; lesley@Irsa.co.za

Subject: S5 1479 & 1480 - Collection 12.10.23 Memo Approval Required

Hi @Pranishwar Maharaj,
Trust you well
Kindly approve the attached memo for collection tomorrow from LR

,@S;cmm@_wwm.mm.ww route code has been changed to CR — Wise will collect tomorrow morning please
@'Kobus Claassens! kindly process QR code for access, details below:

Name: Wiseman Maphanga

Cell: 072 633 7488

ID: 9009105434080

Vehicle Reg: KP31CHG



* LRSA SINGLE PICK FOR COLLECTION / SPEGHA

PROMO PRI1462760
Stock Code Stock Description Packsize Unit Batch Units D._.B
Load ID: 9188090
Pernod Ricard South Africa
PROMOSIE
EA

161104 [nverroche Gin Amber6x750ml 43% 1 EA 20 —

20
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Picked By: %E\Y\ Checked By: §
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