Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191
Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

a

Reg No: 1994/004226/07
Vat No: 4670144973

Tax Invoice
Buyer: The Spar Group Limited .no:&m:mm" Doc No: 1475497
Spar Kwazulu Natal {DC) Spar Kwazulu Natal (DC) Date: 2024-02-23
304 Aberdare Drive 304 >wm:“_m=m Drive Customer: 33296
Phoenix 4068 Phoenix 4068
Branch / Plant: KZND
Warehouse LL; Ref:1725
Order No: 1346712 SO
Liquor License: RG/608
Buyer's VAT: 4120187218
Requested Date: 2024-02-21 Customer PO: 4100067248 Currency: ZAR Payment Term: 15 Days from
CEwRE L i N . S . B statement 1.0%
a?d number ‘\cmmn_,izn: S : co;_s_ \ ; DQ. \ Unit Selling Price ; \ ; Discount .\ ‘ <>H \ A%.m_ Amount
101500 Jameson Standard 12X750ml 43% 16.6666 CA 980.00 319.35 -16.67 533,933.52 3,559,556.78
Total VAT Total Including
533,933.52 4,093,490.30
COD Total 4,052,555.40
A lec] e m\_ Qe e (T
email allached
Banking Details Received in good order on behalf of customer
Account No: 4resr47386 Signature:
Branch 632005 Date:
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Pernod Ricard
South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive
Woodmead, Sandton, GAUTENG, 2191

Phone: 011 802 0600 Fax: 011 802 0620

Reg No: 1994/004226/07

Vat No: 4670144973

Tax Invoice
Buyer: The Spar Group Limited no:mmw:mm" Doc No: 1475497
Spar Kwazulu Natal (DC) Spar Kwazulu Natal (DC) Date: 2024-02-23
304 Aberdare Drive 304 Aberdare Drive Customer: 33296
Phoenix 4068 Phoenix 4068
Branch / Plant; KZND
Warehouse LL: Ref:1725
Order No: 1346712 SO
Liquor License: RG/608
Buyer's VAT; 4120187218
m_ﬁ.s_cmmz.ua_ Date: 2024-02-21 Customer PO: 4100067248 Currency: ZAR Paytnent Term: 15 Days from
S BT e e i i statement 1.0%
:mB :::&m_, B . s . Ommn;vmmz UoM \ . D.J. c:: mm__im vanm ; Emno::.n : N - <>._. A ‘,_.onm_ >30:=w
101500 Jameson Standard 12X750ml| 43% 16.6666 CA 980.00 319.35 -16.67 ; mwwbww.mm ) 3,559,556.78
Total VAT Total Including
- . . / — .~ 533,933.52 4,093,490.30
mh\ ‘ “ (U |~ ‘ COD Total 4,052,555.40
. |/ g g
o el
€ Na \ a Kb@ P
. Cancelle
Banking Details Received in good order on behalf of customer
Account No: *Hesx27386 Signature:
Branch 632005 Date:
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Dudu Mbele

From: Wikus Vermeulen

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2024 14:30
To: Dudu Mbele

Subject: FW: Order Cancellation

Kind Regards
Wikus Vermeulen

office 031705 4986
mobile 082 6602619
emzil  dbn@lrsa.co.za

30 Hillclimb Road, Westmead, 3610

From: Priyaam Moodley <Priyaam.Moodley@spar.co.za>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2024 2:20 PM

To: Lloyd Naicker <Lloyd.Naicker@spar.co.za>; Neshan Orrie <neshan.orrie@pernod-ricard.com>; sisipho.mahlanza@pernod-ricard.com; Julia Ngwenya
<Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>; Wikus Vermeulen <wikus@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Mervyn Naidoo <Mervyn.Naidoo@spar.co.za>; Revashnee Kallichuran <Revashnee.Kallichuran@spar.co.za>

Subject: RE: Order Cancellation

Good day.
Please note that the below po’s have been unscheduled from our system .
Kind regards.

Priyaam Moodley

Management Trainee - Marketing

THE SPAR GROUP LTD|SOUTH AFRICA

(031) 508 5107 | privaam.moodley@spar.co.za

304 Aberdare Dr, Phoenix Industrial, Phoenix, KwaZulu-Natal, 4156
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From: Lloyd Naicker <Lloyd.Naicker@spar.co.za>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2024 1:34 PM

To: Priyaam Moodley <Privaam.Moodley@spar.co.za>; neshan.orrie@pernod-ricard.com; sisipho.mahlanza@pernod-ricard.com; Julia Ngwenya
<Cabangani.Ngwenya@pernod-ricard.com>; 'Wikus Vermeulen' <wikus@Iirsa.co.za>

Cc: Mervyn Naidoo <Mesvyn.Naidoo@spar.co.za>; Lisha Moodley <Lisha.Moodley@spar.co.za>; Wonga Magidela <Wonga.Magidela@spar.co.za>; Revashnee
Kallichuran <Revashnee Kallichuran@spar.co.za>

Subject: RE: Order Canceliation

Hi All

Kindly advise if we can remove these PO’S from the bookings.

Vendor Purchase

zmﬁm:ﬁ No  Material Description No Vendor Name Order Order Quantity Order Unit

1009668 JAMESON IRISH WHISKEY 750ML 4000258 PERNOD RICARD S.A.{TOPS) 4100067249 14 | Pallet (PAL)

1009668 JAMESON IRISH WHISKEY 750ML 4000258 PERNOD RICARD S.A.(TOPS) 4100067248 14 | Pallet (PAL)
Best Regards,

Lloyd Naicker

Receiving Scheduling Controller — SPAR Kwazulu Natal

The Spar Group LTD | South Africa

Tel: +27 (0) 31 508 5339 | Email: Lloyd.Naicker@spar.co.za




304 Aberdare Drive,Phoenix Industrial Park,4068 | P.O. Box 371, Mount Edgecombe 4300

From: Priyaam Moodley <Privaam.Moodley@spar.co.za>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2024 1:07 PM

To: neshan.orrie@pernod-ricard.com; sisipho.mahlanza@pernod-ricard.com

Cc: Mervyn Naidoo <Mervyn.Naidoo@spar.co.za>; Lisha Moodley <Lisha.Moodley@spar.co.za>; Wonga Magidela <Wonga.Magidela@spar.co.za>; Revashnee
Kallichuran <Revashnee.Kallichuran@spar.co.za>; Lloyd Naicker <Lloyd.Naicker@spar.co.za>

Subject: Order Cancellation

Good day.

| hope this email finds you well.
Please be informed that we are cancelling the below PO’s :

Purchase

Zunm;m_zb ‘@d_,.m»m_.mm_Ummn:nzo: o_.dm.qbcm_.::@ Order Unit

= . . Order
1009668 JAMESON IRISH WHISKEY 750ML 4000258 PERNOD RICARD S.A.{TOPS) 4100067249 14 | Pallet (PAL)
1009668 JAMESON IRISH WHISKEY 750ML 4000258 PERNOD RICARD S.A.(TOPS) 4100067248 14 | Pallet (PAL)

Kind regards.

Privaam Moodley

Management Trainee — Marketing

THE SPAR GROUP LTD|{SOUTH AFRICA
(031) 508 5107 | privaam.moodley@spar.co.za

304 Aberdare Dr, Phoenix Industrial, Phoenix, KwaZulu-Natal, 4156
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WHISTLE
BLOWERS &=

I our effort 3o create an ethically compliant business envircnment, Liquct Runners
utilizes the private and confidential services of Whistle Blowers (Ply) Ltd, which iz &
cerfified and registered member of the Ethizs instilute, in order to achieve cur goal.

Private & Confidential

- 080 74 36 367

BLOW THE WHISTLE ON . . (
UNETHICAL ACTIVITIES Irsa@whistleblowing.co.za | SMS: 33490

it AohioliabaaBll (©) VWhatsApp ChatBot: +27 31 308 4664

<

%]

scleimer@sparco za




Pernod Ricard South Africa

Building 6, Country Club Estate GAUTENG ZA 2191
Phone: +264 011 802 0600 Fax: +264 011 802 0600
Reg No: 1994/004226/07
Vat No: 4670144973

Tax Credit note

DOC NO: - 208878
BUYER: Spar Kwazulu Nataj (DC) CONSIGNEE: Spar Kwazulu Natal (DC) Date - 2024/03/25
304 Aberdare Drive 304 Aberdare Drive Customer - 33206
Brn/Plt - KZND
Related P.O. -
Phoenix Phoenix Order Nbr - 145747 CO
4068 4068 Currency - ZAR
Page -1
Vessel: Vat. No. 4120187218
Container ID:
Shipping Terms:
Request Date Customer P.O.
2024/03/25 4100067248
Ln Description Item Lot UoM Shipped Unit Price UOM Qty Volume(L) Volume (M3)  Net Weight
Number Number Pricing Pallets
1.000 Jameson Standard 12X750ml 43% 101500 CA -980.00 302.6834 EA -14 -8,820.00 -26.4600 -15,386.00 -3
-980.00 302.6834 -14 -8,820.00 -26.4600 -15,386.00 -3
Terms 15 Days from statement 1.0% Net Due 2024/04/15 Tax Rate 15%  Sales Tax -533,933.52  Total Order -4
Date

UCR Reference:

2024103/25 16:44:38
UserlD: PRAMLALL
R565A001 7A43000020



3¢ Hillclimb Road
Westmead

Pinetown

Liguor Rumers
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Liquor Runner Durban Durban Hetp: £ Fwww. lrsa.co. 22

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR9203950 2024-03-25 17:53:43
LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID , DATE Delivered -

Selwyn@lrsa.co.za

Reg. No. Truck Description Load Capacity Driver Name Dispatcher Checker

Reason for Credit: Cancelled by Principal
Customer Name: SPAR DC PHOENIX

Brief Description of Credit:
Principal Customer Code: 33296

Doc. Date: 2024-02-23 Doc. Ref: PRI1475497 GRV: CANCELLED Credit Type: Credit Invoice Amt: R 4093490
Stock Code Stock Description Unit Packsize Reason Code Reason Batch QTY
101500 Jameson Standard12X750mt 43% CA 12 P1 Cancelled by Princip 80
Total Number of ltems to be credited on Decument Ref: PRI1475497 (1 Product Type) 982
14

Authorized by:
[date]




