A Customer Order Date:

Cu_stomar Ordar Numbar:
BC0T725105200

ESTABLISKED 1918 KWV Order Number;

Warshay Investmaents Ltd t!a KWV 1109_8'“54
PO Box 528, Suider Paarl 5 7646 |Loading Status:
Telephone: 0021 - 8073911 Deliver
Re%. tNOR N: 2 04112 /0 181789323/ 07
a o: : .
FATR E: FLO- ID »BE03 Gross Weight : 106.050kg

REMARKS: FOR ANY QUERIES CONTACT KWV QUERIES ON 0861 598 598 OR queriessa@kwv.co.za

901080 |700025794 | Fruit Lagoon Mojito 6x750ml cs v & x 750 1.0 440.34 5.80 414.80 414.80 62.22 477.02
901431 (700025395 | Hooch Blast Apple 4(6x440ml) CS wr 24 x 440 2.0 368.76 368.76 737.52 110.63 848.15
901186 |[700022660 | KWV Brandy and Cola 4(6x275ml) Cs 24 x 275 1.0 327.12 4.00 314.04 314.04 47.11 361.15
900170 |700026295 | KWV 3¥r 0ld Brandy 12x200ml cs 12 x 200 1.0 598.68 5.00 568.75 568.75 B5.31 654.06
900190 [700025731 | KWV S5¥Yr Cld Brandy 12x750ml CS 12 x 750 1.0 |2,098.68 4.60 1,997.94 1,997.94 2%9.69 2,297.63
900043 |700026524 | XKWV 3Yr 0ld Brandy 12x750ml + Neck CS 12 x 750 2.0 1,887.00 1.80 1,853.03 3,706.07 §55.91 4,261.98
901340 (700025881 | Pearly Bay Smooth Red Bag in Box ¢x | CS w 4 x 3000 1.0 401.96 401.96 401.96 60.29 462 .25

O LIQUOR MEISES HA.‘.T GOMNUBIE | -

2293
Datemnnnd T "ﬂg‘ﬁgm

GEY numberi. . L 22 T2
ClBIM MUM DT e SR N

VAT NMo.: 4590193324 No. of cases:. |

Relceived in good ordar by:
Signoture: é Printed Nome] JAZQA/

Payment Terms: Bank Details:

Pelivered by Received in good order Depot Signature Cheque Acc
Name: Warshay Investments (Pty) Ltd

Liquor Runner Ocs-Londofi~ ~—~ — - |on bahalf of Customer - - For—Receipt. from Customer .| . _ o | Bank:

2 STRELITZIA STRAAT ‘ FNB oot
BRAELYN Name: Name: Currency: ZAR Acc: 6300 328 6845

Erf: 006168 Signature: Signature: Branch: 250655

008 - LONDON Date: Date:




Carol Lombaard

From: Bornatius Schroeder

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2025 12:18

To: Carol Lombaard

Cc: Feroza De Roos; Orders SA; James Reade-Jahn
Subject: RE: special delivery

Approved

From: James Reade-Jahn
Sent: 17 January 2025 11:56

To: Carol Lombaard <lombaardc@kwv.co.za>; Bornatius Schroeder <schroederb@kwv.co.za>
Cc: Feroza De Roos <deroosf@kwv.co.za>; Orders SA <orderssa@kwv.co.za>

Subject: RE: special delivery

Hi Bornatius

Order came in after stock count cut off, it was allocated and released yesterday but neither | or Carol was notified of it needing to be a late add on.

Customers NDD is today and we can deliver at R1200
Please advise if we may continue?
Regards

James Reade-Jahn

From: Carol Lombaard

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2025 11:53

To: James Reade-lahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.co.za>
Subject: RE: special delivery

Hi



