-

KWV

ESTABLISHED 1918

Customer Ordsr Date:

Customer Order Number:
akhona

KWV QOrder Number:

Warshay Investmants Ltd t/fa KWV 1109_11542
PO Box 528, Suider Paarl, 764& jLoading Status:
Telephone: 021 - 8073511 beliver
Reqj 2012/018792/07 :
at .mg) T RS Gross Weight :  4.327kg

REMARKS: FOR ANY QUERIES CONTACT KWV QUERIES ON 0861 5%8 598

OR queriesga@kwv.co.za

¢k

901362
901234
900136

700024935
700023117
700025440

Hooch Howler Black Currant 6x750ml
Laborie Cap Class Nectar 6x750ml
KWV Classic Sauvignon Blanc 6x750ml

Bot
Bot,
Bot

6 x 750
6 x 750

6 x 750

DT
'93.;3 0.50 92.66
132.81 | o.s0 132.15
1 63.99 7.60 59.13

92.66 13.90 106.56
132.15 19.82 151.97
8.87 68.0Q

§9.13

Daelivered by:-

Liquor Runner Ooa-Léndon
2 STRELITZIA STRAAT .
BRAELYN

Erf: 006168

00S - LONDON

|Recelved in good order ..

on”behalf:of éuatomer

HName:
Signature:
Date:

Depot

| Name :

Date:

Signature

Foxr Receipt from Customer

Signature:

] Payment - Termsa:
15 days from gtmt 1.5% disc

currency: ZAR

Bank - Details. ‘Cheque Acc
Name: Warshay ;nveétments (Pty) Ltd
Bank: .

FNB

Acc : 6300 328 6845
‘Branch: 250655




N
KWV

ESTABLISHED 1918

Customer Ordor Data:

Customer Order Number:
akhona

KWV QOrdar Number:

FAIR E :

FLO-ID 28503

Warshay Investments Pty Ltd t/a KWy [110911542
PO Box 528, Suider aarlé 7646 |Loading Status:
Telephone: 021 - 8073911, Deliver
Reg\’. No. : 2012/018792/07
. Vat Reg No: 4110261833

Gross Weight : 4.327kg

REMARKS: POR ANY QUERIES CONTACT KWV QUERIES ON 0861 598 598 OR queriessa@kwv.co.ze

IR —

901362 (700024985 | Hooch ‘Howler Black Currant 6x750ml Bé,t;
901234 |700023117 | Laborie Cap Class Nectar 6x750ml = | Bot -
900126 |700025440 | KWV Classic Sauvignon Blanc 6x750ml | Bot

‘6 % 750 | 1.0 -93.13 0.50
. 6 x 750 1.0 132.81 0.50 132.15
§ x 750 1.0 63.99 7.60 59.13

852.66
132.15
59.13

13.90 .
19.82
8.87

106.56
151.97
68.00

g

Dalivered by

2 STRELITZIA STRAAT '
BRAELYN ey
- Brf£: 006168

008 - LONDON

{Received in good order
. A

Liguor Runmer Qos-London.

on behalf of éustomer
Name : '
Signature:

Date:

Depot Signature

| Name ¢
Signature:
Date:

For“Receipt from Cuétomer

gty Ir

Payment: -Terms:
R S

15 ‘days from stmt 1.5% disge

Currency: ZAR

Name :
Bank:

Bank Detaila: Cheque Acc
Warghay Investments (Pty} Ltd

Acc: 6300 328 6845
Branch: 250655

i




N

KwV

ESTABLISHED 1918

: Warshay Investmants Ltd t/fa KWV
1 PO Box 528, Suider Paarl 6 6
Telephone 021 - 8073511

Re% N 2041121/00218792 07
a a 01

E: FLO-ID 28503

Customer Order Date:

Customer Order Number:
0041081744

KWV Order Number:
113099843
Loading Status:

Gross Waight : 4.327kg

- REMARKS: FOR ANY QUERIES CONTACT KWV QUERIES ON 0861 598 598 OR queriessaexvv.co.za

Pri

TEE

801362 700024995

Hooch ‘Howler Black Currant 6x750ml o
901234 70002311‘7 Laborie Cap Class Nectar: Gx750m1 Bot
900136 [700025440 ) KWV Classic Sauvignon-llanc 6x750ml | Bot

132.81
-63.99

0.50
7.60

132.15
5%.13

132.15
59.13

19.82
8.87

151.97
68.00

Dalivered. by

2 STRELITZIA STRAAT

BRAELYN cheTas
Brf:
008 - LONDON

’ Li_q:\:llorz;!{unxier Qos :Lcén'doh Teng

".006168 L e

Received in good-order

| on"behal £: of C:uatamarc :

Name:
Signature:
Date:

w4 Name : - y

Depot Signature
E A=Y R R

.| For Receipt - from Customer

Signature: Voosat s
Date:

Paymant. Tarma:

‘,,ku«r:‘u P

15 days from stmt 1.5% disc

B currency: ZAR

|Bank Detail
s Name Wa.rshay Invest:mencs
: Bank- .

ENB

Acc: 6300 328 6845
‘| Branch: 250635

(Pry) Ttd.




oy

Carol Lombaard

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Carol,

Can you please credit the orders that have been invoiced already on the below list:

Peter-John Jacobs

Wednesday, 03 April 2024 09:52

James Reade-Jahn; Loyiso Ngxazana; Carol Lombaard
Anuschka van der Merwe

RE: Invoiced Orders - 02.04.2024

Oul 0F17 Lt~

@Loyiso Ngxazana please reject the ones that have not been invoiced yet.

Kindly confirm once done.

Regards,

PJ

From: James Reade-}ahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.co.za>
Sent: Wednesday, 03 April 2024 08:58

- To: Peter-John Jacobs <jacobspj@kwv.co.za>; Loyiso Ngxazana <ngxazanal@kwv.co.za>



3
~

2 Strelitzia Street 2 Strelitzia Street "

1A

Braelyn .B_ra_elyn
East London " Eastlondon.
5201 5201 ¢
043 743 4557 - 043 7221981
Warehouse@mjpres.co.za - o " Brewmaster Trust East-London :

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR248435 | zﬂq’zg-;o,g;.-os; 08:46:17 -
LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID 23223, DATE Delivered - 2024-04-04 N IR N

Reg. No. Truck Description  Load Capaclty Driver Name Dls'patc_:hé'r'; T Check_ér
Reason for Credit: Cancelled by Principal

Customer Name: Riverbend Tops at Spar 4620
Brief Description of Credit:

Principal Customer Code: TOPBEN

Doc.Date: 2024-04-02 Doc.Ref: 41081744 -




