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900243 |700024459 wooumvmnm Red Blend 2022 cs "6 x 150 2.0 468.78 468.78 mu.._ 56 140.63 H 078.18
900190 /700025731 | KWV 5Yr 0ld Brandy 12x750ml Ccs 12 x 750 | . 2.0 |2,007.96 7.90 1,849.33 3,698.66 554.80 4,253.46
900043 |700025733 | KWV 3Y¥r 0ld Brandy 12x750ml cs 12 x 750 2.0 [1,793.40 10.80 1,599.69 3,199.39 479.91 3,679.30
900131 |700023731| KWV Cabernet Sauvignon 6x750ml 2022 | CS 6 x 750 2.0 413.82 8.00 380.71 761.43 114.21 875.64
900137 |700025441 | KWV Classic Shiraz 6x750ml 2022 cs 6 x 750 2.0 413.82 8.00 380.71 761.43 114.21 875.64
900136 |700025440 | KWV Classic Sauvignon Blanc 6x750ml | CS 6 x 750 2.0 362.52 6.80 337.87 675.74 101.36 777.10
900135 {700023738 | KWV Classic Pinotage 6x750ml 2022 cs 6 x 750 2.0 413.82 8.00 380.71 761.43 114.21 875.64
900237 |700024117 | KWV Sparkling Cuvee Brut 6x750ml cs 6 x 750 2.0 382.74 1.00 378.91 757.83 113.67 871.50
900144 |700025141 | Laborie Merlot 6x750ml 2021 cs 6 x 750 2.0 385.02 5.50 363.84 727.69 109.15 826.84
900186 |700024490 | KWV 10Yr 0ld Brandy 12x750ml cs 12 x 750 2.0 |3,295.56 1.70 3,239.53 6,479.07 971.88 7,450.95
900105 700025140 | Laborie Merlot/Cabernet Sauvignon 6 | CS 6 x 750 2.0 385.02 5.50 363.84 727.69 109.15 836.84
901032 |[700025233 | Hooch Blast Black Currandt 4(6x275m | CS 24 x 275 4.0 258.92 0.80 256.85 1,027.39 154.11 1,181.50
900366 |700024933 | Bonne Esperance Dry Red 4x5000ml Ba | CS 4 x 5000 2.0 573.68 573.68 1,147.36 172.10 1,319.46
901185 {700024861 | Annabelle Cuvee Rose 6x750ml cs 6 x 750 2.0 427.80 2.20 418.39 836.78 125.52 962.30
901365 |700024780 | Wild Africa Cream Caffe Latte (12x7 | CS 12 x 750 1.0 |1,274.76 3.60 1,228.87 1,228.87 184.33 1,413.20
901340 |700025232 | Pearly Bay Smooth Red Bag in Box 4x | CS 4 x 3000 2.0 373.24 0.20 372.49 744.99 111.75 856.74
901395 [700025120 | Bug Stag 10(15x20ml) cs 150 x 20 1.0 |1,452.00 3.00 1,408.44 1,408.44 211.27 1,619.71
ITEMS NPT SUPPLIED:
901431 |700025395 | Hooch Blast Apple 4(6x440ml) cs 24 x 440 2 |Item rejected - No gtock
901405 |700025213 | Bug Blue Shooter 10 (15x20ml) cs 150 x 20 2 | Item rejectled - No dtock ]
901408 {700025215 | Bug Booster Shooter 10(15x20ml) Ccs 150 x 20 2 | Ttem rejectled - No datock
901406 |700025214 | Bug Red Shocter 10(15x20ml) cs 150 x 20 2 | Item rejectfed - No gtock
901433 |700025396 | Hooch Blast Black Currant 4(6x440ml | CS 24 x 440 "2 |Item rejectled - No dtock
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Carol Lombaard

From: Christelle Germishuys

Sent: Monday, 19 January 2026 13:41

To: Carol Lombaard

Subject: RE: POD 41065466

Attachments: Payment Advice Note from 17.12.2024
Hi

Invoice was paid 17.12.2024.

Regards

From: Carol Lombaard <lombaardc@kwv.co.za>
Sent: Monday, 19 January 2026 12:59

To: Christelle Germishuys <Germishuysc@kwv.co.za>
Subject: POD 41065466

Hi Christelle
Please can you check for me if POD 41065466 has been paid for by Jumbo Maclear ©

Kind Regards
Carol

Office: 043 703 8700

Fax: 043 743 4557

E-Mail : lombaardc@kwv.co.za
Braelyn

East London

5201




