109 &7 w1\ b 4o | abeg

Yo [ Lo L) :21eq ¥OI44V HLNOS youeug
\llﬁlU\\ 2anjeusis E€C0G s s sk ke *ON JUnoy
J210ISTY JO Jleyaq o Japio pood 1) paneday speysq Bupjueg
|€30L Q02
000
Suipnpul |etey 1VA |80}
LT 69V LT69Y 00's V2 D0LT 691 %EY WOSLXTT dAIBS3Y SI2pUNOd 18AIUBIH 3YL 002091
wnowy [ejo] 1vYA unoIsiqy anud Susss wun AD won uapdinssq Jaquinu Wy
lusuuialels s i
wouy shep pg e ) JuBtted yvz sAausain) JAVYHL ¥VdS ANZ) OX 9110t ‘04 Jautoisn) LT-60-¥70C :eq paisanbay
:1VA s J9Ang
:asuaaf Jonhil
€S T951¢ ‘ON 1apiQ
STLT 43y 1] osnoYyIJeM
ANZA 2ueld / Yourig
106 118035 0 0
£L1-60-120T 3jea 1uswpeda( sojes |euciieN juswedaq sa|es [euolieN
£/8680ST 0N 300 Paudisuo) JoAng
SI10AU) X€Y ELGYYTOLOY 10N 187

£0/972¥00/vE6T ‘ON 83y

0790 708 TTO :Xe4 0090 208 TTO :2Uoyd

T6TZ 'ONILNYD ‘UCIPUES ‘PESWPOOM

3ALIQ SPUBIPOOA TZ ‘218153 qn|D Al3uneD ‘g Suipjing

LOUFY Umos
PIDOR] pouted

|




L/L OV LG:€L /1/60/¥202

g PEYOSYS) oAt \»w kg paxoId
g
G e m.uz o [4} I %EP WOG/XT L 9AISS3Y SI9pUN0] 18AHUIID dY 1 007091
- 9 L
il - Nvaina 301440 dON¥3d
B - - ©OL1JV YINOS pJiediy pou.ad |
k L£6G1 I Peo]

ALD sHUf) ysreg uun azisyded uondiosag Xo0Is  2poJ 3015
/868051 14d 44V1SVSyd

AYIAITAA TVIDIAAS / NOIDFTFTFOD HO4 MIId TONIS VSH'T




L ' 7oz 1equiaidas /| Aepsany

000 00°S 00°¢

4] § S Tl £ JW0GIXTI9AIDSRY SIePUNO 1DALURD S L 0067094 9670 ¥Z0Z/60/40
asueLIeA ALT UBIS  ALD SHUN HUn azigyed 3580 1S apo3J 1§ pauuedg
£86806G114d SL3TTVd 0 JAIFDIY OL NvadNnd 321440 QONY3d

LE6GL FII0ANI FTONIS Y04 LHOdIY IDNVIIVA VST




Q\l
£

Pernod Ricard South Africa

nd

MEMORANDUM - PERMISSION TO COLLECT GOODS

Date 17th September 2024
Requested by Sam Pillay
Warehouse KZND

Customer name Spar Trade Show2
Customer number 901

Invoice number 53 21560

Total amount of goods to be collected R31,251.36

Reason for collection

To whom it may concern

| hereby grant Zamokuhle Hadebe to act as a company representative to collect the goods listed above from the
warehouse on this day 17" September 2024.

Furthermore, kindly ensure that the sales representative returns
the following:
e Signed POD

Should the sales representative have any POD’s or unpaid COD/Cash outstanding — DO NOT ALLOW THE
COLLECTION?

Kindly note any order more than R50 000.00 cannot be collected by the sales representative due to good-in-
transit insurance coverage.

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at 011 802 0600 at your earliest
convenience.

Kind Regards

X

Riya Harichunder

Finance Manager

PERNOD RICARD SOUTH AFRICA (Pty) Ltd. Reg No. 1994/004226/07
Building 6, Country Club Estate, 21 Woodlands Drive, Woodmead, Sandton, Gauteng, 2191. Postal: PO Box 4292. Halfway House. 1685
Phone: +27 (0)11 802 0600, Fax: +27 (0)11 802-0620
Directors: Soia Oke*, Gaetan Magdelain**, Nthabiseng Motsoeneng, Shireen Maharaj
*Nigerian **French




Dudu Mbele

From: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 12:40

To: Sam Pillay; SSA - SA - Group Debtors; Dudu Mbele; Jonathan Govender

Cc: Andrew Morris; Zamokuhle Hadebe; Phillipe Rampedi; Brandon Pillay

Subject: RE: Spar Trade Show Notes - MEMO'S Approval Required

Attachments: Memo Zamo1.docx; Memo Zamo2.docx; Memo Zamo3.docx; KZND Spar Trade
Show 30416 XO.pdf

Approved

Pranishwar Maharaj
Accounts Receivable Manager | Pernod Ricard South Africa
My working hours may be different from yours so please do not feel obliged to reply outside your normal working hours

From: Sam Pillay <sam.pillay@pernod-ricard.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2024 12:15 PM

To: Pranishwar Maharaj <pranishwar.maharaj@pernod-ricard.com>; SSA - SA - Group Debtors
<GroupDebtors@pernod-ricard.com>; Dudu Mbele <dudu@Irsa.co.za>; Jonathan Govender
<jonathan.govender@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Andrew Morris <Andrew.Morris@pernod-ricard.com>; Zamokuhle Hadebe <zamokuhle.hadebe @pernod-
ricard.com>; Phillipe Rampedi <Phillipe.Rampedi@pernod-ricard.com>; Brandon Pillay <Brandon.Pillay@pernod-
ricard.com>

Subject: FW: Spar Trade Show Notes - MEMO'S Approval Required

Importance: High

Hi @Pranishwar Maharaj,
Trust you well
As discussed with Andrew, please find memo's attached for your approval for the Spar Trade Show

@Jonathan Govender, kindly assist with QR code creation for Zamo:

Name: Zamokuhle Hadebe
iD No: 8911285406088
Vehicle Reg: NUR 68601

Cell No: 077 603 0887

@Dudu Mbele, kindly confirm collection time this afternoon

Thanks so much

Warm regards

Sam Pillay
Sales Administrator East | Pernod Ricard South Africa
My working hours may be different from yours so please do not feel obliged to reply outside your normal working hours

From: Phillipe Rampedi <Phillipe.Rampedi@pernod-ricard.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2024 11:38 AM
To: Valencia Phakathi <Valencia.Phakathi@ pernod-ricard.com>; Andrew Morris <Andrew.Morris@ pernod-
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