TRUMAN

NEILEINTS -

&)

EILL TO:

Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
1 Scheffer Road

Stanger KWAZULU NATAL 4450

South Africa _

Tel: 032 552 3059/ 69

e :

Truman and Qrange
30 Hudson Street

De Waterkant

Cape Town, 8001

021 035 1629
trumanandorange.com
VAT No: 468 0266 949

SHIP TO:

TAX Invoice

VAT Number:
Distributor NLA:
Invoice Number:
Crder Number:
Customer Ref:
Invoice Date:
Due Date:
Customer ID:
Currency:

Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
1 Scheffer Road

Stanger KWAZULU NATAL 4450

South Africa

Tel: 032 552 3059 / 69

VAT Number: 4920267012

468 026 6949
RGOOOS467
INV-203937
SQ184204
45472
13-Mar-2025
22-Mar-2025
MANOOO1
ZAR

CUSTOMER REF. NER. TERMS CONTACT
Disc. wiltin 7 days of lvoice 1% | |
NO. ITEM aTy. oM UNIT PRICE TPR DISC. EXTENDED PRIiCE
1 KR1100100 : Kraken Black Spiced Rum 750ml 2.0000 EACH 407.000 0% 814.00
40% Alc
2 SEAGIN-T50ML : SEAGRAMS GIN 750ML 43% 48.0000 EACH 192.500 5.421% 8739.10
Payment Details ; Bank Details : Truman and Orange {Pty) Ltd Sales Total: 2553.10
RMB Corporate Banking Tax Total: 1432.97
Please use invoice number as Corporate Cheque Accaunt
payment reference, Account No: 62935790437
Branch Code: 255005 Total {ZAR): 10 986.07

Received By (Print Name)

Date Received:

Signature:

Page: 1of1



TAX Invoice

VAT Number: 468 026 6949
Truman and Crange Distributor NLA: RGDOO5467
10 Hudsan Street Invaice Number: INV-203937
De Waterkant Order Number; S5Q184204
| Cape Tawn, 800t Customer Ref: 45472
n-nu.lm TR 021 0351629 Invaice Date: 13-Mar-2025
trumanandorange.com Due Date: 22-Mar-2025
VAT No: 468 0266 949 Customer ID: MANOOGC1
Currency: ZAR
BILL TS: SHIF TO:
Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors Bhargavi investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
1 Scheffer Road 1 Schefier Road
Stanger KWAZULU NATAL 4450 Stanger KWAZULU NATAL 4450
South Africa South Africa
Tel: 032 552 3059 / 69 Tel: 032 552 3059 / 69

VAT Number: 4920267012

CUSTOMER REF. NBR. TERMS CONTACT
45472 . Disc. wilhin 7 days of Involee 1% — | T
NO. ITEM QTY. uom UNIT FRICE TPR DISC. EXTENDED FRICE
1 KR1100100 ; Kraken Black Spiced Rum 750ml 2.0000 EACH 407.000 0% 814.00
40% Alc
2 SEAGIN-T50ML : SEAGRAMS GIN 750ML 43% 48.0000 EACH 192.500 5421% 8739.10
Payment Details : Bank Detalls : Truman and Orange (Pty) Ltd Sales Total: 9553.10
RMB Corporate Banking Tax Total: 1432.97
Please use invoice number as Corporate Cheque Account
payment reference, Account No: 62935790437
Branch Code: 255005 Total (ZAR): 10 986.07

Received By (Print Name)

Date Received;

Signature:

Page: 1 of 1



LRSA SINGLE PICK FOR COLLECTION 7 SPECIAL DELIVERY

1INV-203937T0

Stock Code Stock Description Packsize Unit

Load ID: 65029
Truman and o_,m:mn
MANOR LIQUORS SCHEFFI

Batch "

TOKR1100100U Kraken Black Spiced Rum 750mi 40% Alc .
TOSEAGIN-750MLU  SEAGRAMS GIN 750ML 43% 48

50

Checked By:.

11




Bexanca Manilal

From: Charmaine Swanson <charmaineswanson@trumanandorange.com>

Sent: Waednesday, 19 March 2025 10:02

To: Tamzyn Johnson; Sanjeev Nandlali; Beyanca Manilal

Cc: Kasthuri Naidoo; Orders

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - RE: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
Hi Tamzyn

Noted and will do

@ Beyanca please send credit request

CHARMAINE SWANSON
t.+27(21) 0351629
e. charmaineswanson@trumanandorange.com

.......

This email is confidential and intended for the addressee(s) only. its unauthorised disclosure is forbidden. The
information contained in this message is confidential and is

intended for the addressee only. If you received this message in error or there are any problems please notify
the originator immediately. The unauthorised use, disclosure,

copying or alteration of this message is strictly forbidden. TRUMAN & ORANGE (PTY) LTD will not be liable for
direct, special, indirect or consequential | damages arising

fromalteration of the contents of this message by a third party or as a result of any virus being passed on.

From: Tamzyn Johnson <Tamzyn.Johnson@trumanandorange.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 March 2025 09:47

To: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev.Nandlall@trumanandorange.com>; Beyanca Manilal <beyanca@Irsa.co.za>;
Charmaine Swanson <charmaineswanson@trumanandorange.com>

Cc: Kasthuri Naidoo <kasthuri@Irsa.co.za>; Orders <orders@trumanandorange.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - RE: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

n take note of below once order is cancelled, please process a full

“a Manilal please cancel order.

Kind Regards,
Tamzyn Johnson



021035 1629

info@trumanandorange.cam

trumanandorange.com

@trumanandorange

From: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev.Nandlall@trumanandorange.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 2:41 AM

To: Beyanca Manilal <beyanca@Irsa.co.za>; Tamzyn Johnson <Tamzyn,Johnson@trumanandorange.coms>
Cc: Kasthuri Naidoo <kasthuri@lrsa.co.za>

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] - RE: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

Morning. Please can the order be canceled @ Viresh request. New order placed. Please can
the new order be delivered this week.

Kind Regards!
Sanjeev Nandlall
+27 066 292 3639

Sanjee diail@tru

From: Beyanca Manilal <bevanca@Irsa.co.za>

Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 9:13:48 AM

To: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev.Nandlall@trumanandorange.com:>; Tamzyn Johnson
<Tamzyn.Johnson@trumanandorange.com>

Cc: Kasthuri Naidoo <kasthuri@lrsa.co.za>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] - RE: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liguors

_CAUTION This emall onglnated from out5|de of the organ[zatson Do not click links or open attachments unless you'
recognize the sender and knowthe content is safe e :

Good morning, Sanjeev

Trust you are well , please note order was not yet delivered .

Kind Regards
Beyanca Manilal

office: 0310231141
mobile: 074 0831808
email: beyanca®@lrsa.co.za



Pocket 3A Clairwood Logistics Park,
C/0 Basil February Road,
Clairwood, 4060

From: Kasthuri Naidoo <kasthusi@lrsa.co.za>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 March 2025 09:09
To: Beyanca Manilal <beyanca@irsa.co.za>

Cc: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev. Nandiall@trumanandorange com>; Tamzyn Johnson

<Tamzyn.Johnson@trumanandorange.com:>
Subject: RE: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

Hi Beyanca
Please see below and give feedback
Thank you

Kind Regards
Kasthuri Naidoo
office: 0310231141

mobile: 0828715018
email: kasthuri®@lrsa.co.za

Pocket 3A Clairwood Logistics Park,
C/O Basil February Road,
Clairwood, 4060

Liquor Rumers

From: Tamzyn lohnson <Tamzyn.Johnson@trumanandorange.com:>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 March 2025 09:04

To: Kasthuri Naidoo <kasthuri@|rsa.co.za>

Cc: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev.Nandlall@trumanandorange.com:>
Subject: FW: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manaor Liquors

Please advise if this was delivered yet.

Kind Regards,
Tamzyn Johnson




G2t 0351624

info@trumanandorange.com

trumanandorange.com

@trumanandorange

r;,"\

t LY

2 in

From: Sanjeev Nandlall <Sanjeev.MNandlall@trumanandorange.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2025 4:02 PM

To: Tamzyn Johnsen <Tamzyn.fohnson@trumanandgrange.com>
Subject: Fw: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

Hi Tamzyn. Find attached Manor Liquors invoice that the customer wants canceled due to non
delivery. New order placed Refer order number 045529,

Kind Regards!
Sanjeev Nandlall

+27 066 292 3639

From: trumanandorange inv <trumanandorange.iny @trumanandorange.com:

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 10:05:05 AM

To: kasthuri@lrsa.co.za <kasthuri@lrsa.co.za>; priscilla@lrsa.co.za <priscila@Irsa.co.za>; beyanca@|rsa.co.za
<bhevanca@irsa.co.za>

Cc: Orders <grders@trumanandorange.com>; Sanjeev Nandlal <Sanieev.Nandlall@trumanandorange.com>
Subject: INV-203937 Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

Dear Liquor Runners DBN

Attached please find invoice no: INV-203937 for the Shipment no: 190435 and Sales Order
N0:5Q184204 to be delivered to: Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors

Kind Regards

T&0O



Clairwood Logistics Park Clairwood Logistics Park
Basil February Read Basil February Road
Mobeni East e Mobeni East

E Liguor Rumers "

Liguor Runner Clairwood Clairwood

Selwyn@lrsa.co.za Http:/ fwww.rsa.co.za

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR65029 2025-03-19 14:37:27
LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID , DATE Delivered -
Reg. No. Truck Description Load Capacity Driver Name ‘Dispatcher Checker

Reason for Credit: Cancelled by Principal -- L
y P Gustomer Name: MANOR LIQUORS SCHEFFER
Brief Description of Credit: i ; *

Principal Customer Coda: MANCOO1

_.-_CﬁfeditType: Cancel - NS Invoice Amt: R 10986.1

Doc. Date: 2025-03-13 Doc. Ref: INV-203937TO GRV:

Stock Code Stock Description Unit “'Reason Code Reason Batch QTY
TOKR1100100U  Kraken Black Spiced Rum 750ml 40% Alc’ EA ”1 X750ML M Cancelled by Princip 2
TOSEAGIN-750M  SEAGRAMS GIN 750ML 43% EA . 1K 750ML P1 Cancelled by Princip 48

Total Number of [tems ta be credited on Decument Ref; 1NV-3.039.37T0 {2 Product Type) 50

Authorized by: 14

[date]




n II“ 3

BILL TO:

Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
1 Scheffer Road

Stanger KWAZULL NATAL 4450

South Africa

Tel: 032 552 3059 /69

Truman ard Orange
30 Hudsen Street

De Waterkant

Cape Town, 8001

021 035 1629
trumanandorange.com
VAT No: 468 01656 94%

SHIP TO:

Bhargavi Investments CC t/a Manor Liquors
1 Scheffer Road

Stanger KWAZULU NATAL 4450

South Africa

Tel: 032 552 3059/ 68

VAT Number:
Distributor NLA:
Invoice Number:
Order Number:
Cuatomer Ref:
Invoice Date:
Due Date:
Customer ID:
Currancy:

TAX Credit Memo

463 026 €943
RGOOO6467
CN33778
RC1230%
INV-203937
13-Mar-2025

MANCO01
ZAR

VAT Number. 4320257012

CUSTOMER REF, MER, TERMS CONTACT
[ s ]
NO, ITEM aTy. uom UNIT PRICE TPR DISC, EXTENDED PRICE
1 KR1100100 ; Kraken Black Spiced Rum 750m| 2.0000 EACH 407.000 0% 814.00
40% Ale
2 SEAGIN-750ML : SEAGRAMS GIN 750ML 43% 48,0000 EACH 192.500 5.421% 8739.10
Payment Details : Bank Details : Truman and Crange [Ply) Lid Sales Total: 8 583,10
RMB Corporate Banking Tax Tatal: 143297
Please use invoice number as Gorporate Chegue Account !
payment referenca. Account No: 62935790437
Branch Code: 255005 Total [ZAR): 10 98607

Received By (Print Name}

Date Received:

Signature:

Pags: 1 af 1



