CREDIT NOTE

Invoice Number Sap Order
7746042595 10244109
Invoice Date Purchase Order No
28.08.2024 9746191894
Invoice Address

CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 25160790
CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC

299 REFINERY ROAD

4115 ISIPINGO

SOUTH AFRICA

Customer VAT Number:

Sap Order Date Account Number
28.08.2024 211615
Delivery Address

CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 25160790
CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC

299 REFINERY ROAD

4115 ISIPINGO

Liquor Licence : N/A

DIAGEO Page 1/1

Diageo South Africa

Building 3, Maxwell Office Park, Magwa
Crescent,

Waterfall City, Midrand, 2090

REG NO. 1964/003344/07

VAT Reg: 4750101802 NLA: RG0002237

Payment Terms

End of Month
Bank : CITIBANK N A SOUTH AFRICA SANDTON
CITIBANK N A SOUTH AFRICA/350005

Product Description Qty UoM List Price Customer Promotional ~ Amount Excl VAT Amount Incl VAT
Discount Discount VAT
787266 Smirnoff 1818 75¢1  12X01 3 CAS -1.647,68 1.235,76 -3.707,28 -556,09 -4,.263,37
Subtotal 3.707,28-
Sales Order Notes: Taxable Amount ZAR 3.707,28
VAT Rate 15%
Tax Amount ZAR 556,09-
Total Due ZAR 4.263,37-
ESD 0,00




Clairwood Logistics Park Clairwood Logistics Park
Basil February Road
Mobeni East

4060

Basil February Road
Mobeni East

%% L/b[/ﬁf' ﬁa’ﬂll‘f’ﬁ 4060

Liquor Runner Clairwood Clairwood

Selwyn@lrsa.co.za o/ www.lrsa.co.za

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR4244 2024-0:
LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID , DATE Delivered -

Reg. No. Truck Description Load Capacity Driver Name Dis aféher'

Reason for Credit: Not Ordered / Duplicated
Brief Description of Credit:

Principal Customer Code: 211615

Doc. Date: 2024-07-24 Doc. Ref: 9746191894 GRV:

Stock Code Stock Description ’ Unit  Packsize Reason ( . Batch. . QTY
787266 Smirnoff 1818 75c  12X01 e 12x75M W2 tOrdered /Dupl 0
787266 SMIRNOFF 1818 NEW PACK 12 X 750ML cs 12 X 750ML° Not Ordered / Dupl 3
Total Number of ltems to be credited on Decument Ref: 9746191894 (1 Product Type 3

Authorized by: : i _ . . 1

[date]



TAX INVOICE

Tax Invoice

| | DIAGEO ™"
Invoice Number SAP Order Sap Order Date Account Number GRV Required
9746191894 i 117831644 - 72.07.2024 211615 Building 3, Maxwell Park, Magwa Crescent, Waterfal
Invoice Date PO Number Delivery Date Plant / Bay Order type m”ur _M__m__‘m:a, 2090
. s g: 4750101802 NLA: RG0000525
24.07.2024 12.07.2024 D Na.ew\.gﬁ DNJ1/DN1114244 Duty _wm:_ CustomBrService TEIEpHREZ0800 600 230
. ) i
Invoice Address - CHRTSTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 25160790, HRPSTOPRER ARBNRS ALLOC 25160790 Payment Terms g of Nonth
Bank “CITIBANK N A SOUTH AFRICA SANDTON 0200079094 / 350005
89 REFINERY ROAD, 4115, ISIPINGO 99 REFINERY ROAD o/
p- J 4115, ISIPINGO
Product Description Liguor muu}w:mm" &m,w_,\_ List Price Customer Discount Promotional Discount Amount excl Vat Vat Amount incl
187266 Smirnoff 1818  75cl 1241 3 CAS 1,647.68 -1,235.76 3,107.28 556.09 4,163.37
ARY RETURHS RUST BE HOTED OR THIS DOCUMEHT AND ITS copY o
\mm_mm Order Notes /\ Receipt Name Signature Date Y Taxable Value Rand 310028
From Vat Rate 15%
Notes: Diageo . me _>_w.6c2 Rand 556.09
Total Due
— — “eep 4,263.37
Receipt Name Signature Date (Oc:\m:Q 0.00
From . ZAR
Customer QUGU ™MNSomi B 1io-07T.290 -t
— A J

Sizning this document is & legal requirement

AR



Pick Up 211615 Shipment No:
From: CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 25160790
CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC
299 REFINERY ROAD

4115 TSIPINGO

Returns Delivery No: 191103087

Returns No: 10244109
Warehouse Bond Nos: .
PO Number: 9746191894
: Seal No:

Order Reason: AQ0l1 Return: CUSTOMER ERROR

- ) : Transportation DBDN48M100
Pick Up Date: 29.08.2024 Zone:
Shipping Instructions:
Material Quantity UoM|Batch Confirmed

787266 Smirnoff 1818 75cl

Batch on Liba - L‘éﬁ%m“ FOOE

Driver: Signature: Date:
Vehicle Registration:

Customer: Signature: Date:
Remarks:

* Please Note:Any Discrepancies (in terms of pack and/or quantity return
must be clearly marked on this document and its copy.
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Channal Govender

e T ki

From: Mdongwe, Andisa <Andisa.Mdongwe@diageo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2024 13:07

To: Mokoena, Thabang; Mtshali, Brian M; Channal Govender

Cc: Ruele, Jeminah; Msomi, Gugu (Contractor); Shaun Munsami; Jean Kruger; Nickolai Naidoo; Zita, Themba
Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Released

From: Mokoena, Thabang <Thabang.Mokoena@diageo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 11:16 AM

To: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; channal@Irsa.co.za; Mdongwe, Andisa <Andisa.Mdongwe@diageo.com>

Cc: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger
<jean@Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Thanks Brian

disa

please release the below RFC.
10244109

Regards
Thabang

From: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 10:58 AM

To: Mokoena, Thabang <Thabang.Mokoena@diageo.com>; channal @Irsa.co.za; Mdongwe, Andisa <Andisa.Mdongwe @diageo.com>

Cc: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger
<jean@Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Hi,



Approved.

Thanks and Regards
Brian Mishali
Customer Service Manager

DIAGEOQ South Africa | 299 Refinery Road, Isipingo
Tel: 031 9105030 | Mob: 0769882002

olin] £P-°

iimmw.:; CEEER  quongsy Ao @%w&c_& P— Ly i
oo BELLS sl

From: Mokoena, Thabang <Thabang.Mokoena@diageo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 10:50 AM

To: channal@I|rsa.co.za; Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Mdongwe, Andisa <Andisa.Mdongwe @diageo.com>
Cc: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele @diageo.com>; Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger
Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Hi Channal

The RFC for 3 cases has been created however, we need an approval for it to be released.

please approve so that we can ask to release.

RFC number:10244109

Regards
Thabang

From: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 9:54 AM




To: Mokoena, Thabang <Thabang.Mokoena@diageo.com>
Subject: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Hi Thabang
Hope you are doing well.

Kindly assist with the below.

With regards
Jeminah Ruele

DIAGEO | Building 3, Maxwell Office Park, Magwa Crescent, WATERFALL CITY, MIDRAND 2090
Tel: +27 (0) 800 600 230

»
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Diageo is committed to promoting responsible drinking - visit www.DRINKiQ.com to find out more

From: Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 9:39 AM

To: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger
i Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Good Morning

Following up on the below. Please can a YRET be created for this urgently.



Kind Regards
Channal Govender
office: 0310231141

mobile: 0677241712
email: channal@lrsa.co.za

Pocket 3A Clairwood Logistics Park,
C/0 Basil February Road,
Clairwood, 4060

Liguor Rumers

From: Channal Govender

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2024 16:06

To: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele @diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger
i Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@lrsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Good day

Stock was received in Clairwood. @] Please can you create a YRET for this stock as this ordered was already closed off.
Kind Regards
Channal Govender

office: 0310231141
mobile: 0677241712



email:

Pocket 3A Clairwood Logistics Park,
C/0 Basil February Road,
Clairwood, 4060

From: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2024 12:08

To: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger <jean
Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>
Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>;

Hi Jeminah
I have already sent the stuff to Shaun last week to send it back to the Depot.
@ Shaun was the stuff sent to the Depot i.e 3x Smirnoff cases?

Kind Regards
Gugu Msomi
Receptionist

@©JLL

Diageo Account

299 Refinery Drive
Isipingo Beach

4115

+27 31 910 5000
Mobile: +27 73 928 3848
Email: gugu.msomi@di

From: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 10:22 AM




To: Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@]rsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger <jean@]Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>
Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>; Msomi, Gugu {Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>
Subject: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Good day

May you kindly advise when will this be sorted. | need to release the order for delivery on Friday

With regards
Jeminah Ruele

DIAGEO | Building 3, Maxwell Office Park, Magwa Crescent, WATERFALL CITY, MIDRAND 2090
Tel: +27 (0) 800 600 230
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Diageo is committed to promoting responsible drinking - visit www.DRINKiQ.com to find out more
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From: Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@|rsa.co.za>

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 10:08 AM

To: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Jean Kruger <jean
<nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo

Hi Gugu

Willdo now.



Thanks

From: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 9:40 AM

To: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@lrsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger <jean
Channal Govender <channal@lrsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>
Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@lrsa.co.za>;

Hi Shaun
Can you please send the guys to collect the 3x cases Smirnoff 1818 that are supposed to be returned back at the Depot.

Kind Regards
Gugu Msomi
Receptionist

@)JLL

Diageo Account

299 Refinery Drive

Isipingo Beach

4115

+27 31 910 5000

Mobile: +27 73 928 3848

Email: gugu.msomi@diageo.com

From: Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 9:33 AM

To: Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@|rsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger <jean@Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>; Channal Govender <channal@I|rsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>; Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>
Subject: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Good day

May you please sort out urgently as there is an order that | need to release.



Customer 211615

Company Code 5082
Hame CHRISTOPHER KHUMALC ALLOC 251607380
City _ ISTPINGO

4400583423

24.07.2024

211615 1054673236 Duplicat:

97461918941 31.07.2024]

With regards
Jeminah Ruele

DIAGEO | Building 3, Maxwell Office Park, Magwa Crescent, WATERFALL CITY, MIDRAND 2090
Tel: +27 (0) 800 600 230
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Diageo is committed to promoting responsible drinking - visit www.DRINKiQ.com to find out more

From: Ruele, Jeminah

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 2:49 PM

To: Msomi, Gugu (Contractor) <Gugu.Msomi@diageo.com>; Khumalo, Christopher M <Christopher.Khumalo@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>
Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>; Jean Kruger <jean@Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>
Subject: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079




Hi Gugu

As discussed, see below

With regards
Jeminah Ruele

DIAGEO | Building 3, Maxwell Office Park, Magwa Crescent, WATERFALL CITY, MIDRAND 2090
Tel: +27 (0) 800 600 230
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Diageo is committed to promoting responsible drinking - visit www.DRINKIQ.com to find out more

From: Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 12:25 PM

To: Jean Kruger <jean@Irsa.co.za>; Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Channal Govender <channal@Irsa.co.za>
Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

External-Email: Be cautious of clicking any link or attachment unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi
No, this stock was not given to us.

Kind Regards



From: Jean Kruger <jean@irsa.co.za>

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 12:23 PM

To: Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@Irsa.co.za>
Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>; Channal Govender
<channal@Irsa.co.za>

Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Hi Shaun

Did the team give the below order back to you ?

Kind Regards

From: Zita, Themba <Themba.Zita@diageo.com>

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 12:19 PM

To: Jean Kruger <jean@Irsa.co.za>; Nickolai Naidoo <nickolai@I|rsa.co.za>
Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>
Subject: RE: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

a please confirm if the below was actioned?

Regards
Themba

From: Zita, Themba

Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2024 4:29 PM

To: jean@lrsa.co.za; nickolai@lrsa.co.za

Cc: Mtshali, Brian M <Brian.Mtshali@diageo.com>; Shaun Munsami <shaun.munsami@Irsa.co.za>; Ruele, Jeminah <Jeminah.Ruele@diageo.com>
Subject: 211615 CHRISTOPHER KHUMALO ALLOC 2516079

Hi,

Please note the below was duplicated, can you arrange for stock to be send back to DN11 and the customer to be credited.
Ref: 117831644
10



Please assist

Regards
Themba

This email is sent on behalf of a member of the Diageo group of companies, whose holding company is Diageo plc, registered in England and Wales
with number 23307 and with registered address at 16 Great Marlborough Street, London, W1F 7HS, England.

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are addressed.

This footnote also confirms that this email has been scanned for all viruses by the Microsoft 0365 service.

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not peruse, use,
disseminate, distribute or copy this message or file which is attached to this message. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-
mail, facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the original message. Any views of this communication are those of the sender except where the sender
specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa with Registered Office at 254 OR Tambo Drive, Hamilton, Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please
note that the recipient must scan this e-mail and any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible to protect information from viruses, we do not accept any
liability of whatever nature for any loss, damage or expense resulting directly or indirectly from the access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail
message.

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are addressed. If you have received this
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