Flare Beverages (Pty) Ltd
Credit Request #101784
07 October 2024 at 10:59 Fl

_ARE

VERALAGES

To Kamiki Promotions (Pick warehouse) Placed By Sales Admin
Customer Code PRO052 Warehouse CPT

Code Product Unit Qty  Price (ZAR) Tax Amount (ZAR)
Incl.
K0004 Umiki Whisky 750ml 46% - K0004 750ml 1 / 799.00  (15.00%) 799.00
1 ltem R 799.00
Subtotal (Incl.) R 799.00
Tax R 104.22
Total (Incl.) R 799.00

Comment
REF TO IN164067

Reference
Returns from Whisky Brother Whisky Show

Recipients

PRODUCT CODE | CASES | w4i7s PEASCH
Signature )4 oo U-
A
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C/0 Range rd & Anfield rd
Bltackheath

Kuilsrivier

Cape Town

£

Liguor Rumers

(021) 903 3880

Pieter@lrsa.co.za Liquor Runners Cape Town

C/o Range rd & Anfield rd
Blackheath

Kuilsrivier

Cape Town

(021) 903 8874

Hitp://www.lrsa.co.za

REQUEST FOR CREDIT - CR1431742
LOAD SHEET Reference - LSID , DATE Delivered -

Reg. No. Truck Description  Load Capacity Driver Name

Reason for Credit: Client Returned
Brief Description of Credit:

Principal Customer Code: UPLIFTMENT

Dispatcher

2024-10-10 04:56:41

Checker

Customer Name: FLARE UPLIFTS OFFICE COL

Doc. Date: 2024-10-08 Doc. Ref: UPL101784 GRV: § Credit Type: Upliftment Invoice Amt: R0

Stock Code Stock Description Unit Packsize  Reason Code Reason Batch QTY

FKO004U UMIKL WHISKY 750ML (UNIT) EA 1 x 750ML w5 Client Returned 1

Total Number of Items to be credited on Decument Ref: UPL101784 (1 Product Type) 1
(Al

Authorized by:
[date]




Thantaswa Siyepu

- — I
From: Edgar April - Flare Beverages <Edgar@flarebev.co.za>
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 10:39
To: Thantaswa Siyepu
Ce: Sylvig-Diedericks; teeAnmeBaartran
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR CREDIT IN166399, UPL101784, UPL101781, IN166416, IN166401
Attachments: PRO041_1C034421_20241008120318.pdf; FB0336_IC034437_20241010102429.pdf; FB0596_1C034438_20241010102852.pdf; FB0O003

_1C034439_20241010103215.pdf

Hi Thandi,
| have done a GRV for the Kamiki on the 8" instead of a Credit.(CR1431742)

Kind Regards

Edgar April
Finance and Operations Manager

Tel +27(0)21 905 8163

Fax +27(0)86 2312643

Cell +083 703 8719

email: edgar@flarebev.co.za

Web: www.flarebev.co.za

From: Thantaswa Siyepu <Irheincptl@lrsa.co.za>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 08:57

To: Edgar April - Flare Beverages <Edgar@flarebev.co.za>

Cc: Sylvia Diedericks <ct@Irsa.co.za>; Lee Anne Baartman <leeanne®@Irsa.co.za>
Subject: REQUEST FOR CREDIT IN166399, UPL101784, UPL101781, IN166416, IN166401



Good day
Trust allis well, please find attached credit request.

Kind Regards

——ThandiSiyepu

office 0219038874
email lrheincpti@lrsa.co.za

C/0 Range and Anfield Rd, Blackheath, Cape town, 7599
”
ﬂuv Ligquor Rameers

DISCLAIMER This message may contain information which is confidential, private or privileged in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, you
may not peruse, use, disseminate, distribute or copy this message or file which is attached to this message. If you have received this message in
error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail, facsimile or telephone and thereafter return and/or destroy the original message. Any views of
this communication are those of the sender except where the sender specifically states them to be those of Liquor Runners South Africa with
Registered Office at 254 OR Tambo Drive, Hamilton, Bloemfontein, 9301, (+27) 51 435 4711. Please note that the recipient must scan this e-mail and
any attached files for viruses. While we do everything possible to protect information from viruses, we do not accept any liability of whatever nature
for any loss, damage or expense resulting directly or indirectly from the access and/or downloading of any files which are attached to this e-mail
message.



