21 Purlin Street North, 21 Industrial Estate 21 Purlin Street North,21 Industriat Estate
Clayviile Clayville

o @7@ Ligaor Ramers s

0§2-010-3142
Shaun®lrsa.co.za Liquor Runners Johannesburg Http:/ fwww.lrsa.co.za

GRV for KWV (PTY) LTD - LRSA NR: 13326 (GRY)

Receiver: Bongane Mathebuta
Checker: Nokwazi Mbuyane Receive Date: 2024-11-19
Warehouse LLTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM WarehouseRecv: LiQUOR RUNNERS JHB
Sender Ref 1: 41134136 Sender Ref 2: 41134136
SKU Code Stock Description Bin Batch Number  QTY(Cases) QTY(Units)
Full Cases
700026112 KWY BRANDY AND COLA CAN (24 X 440ML) CL24234 BB2 50 0
700025944 BUG BLUE SHOOTER 10 X 15 X 20ML L24294 63 0
700025945 BUG RED SHOOTER {10 X 15 X 20ML) L24217 63 ¢
700025396 HOOCH BLAST BLACK CURRANT CAN 440ML L24230 BB31 80 0
700026198 ANNABELLE ROSE PERLE CAN {24 X 250ML) L24243 BB31 100 0
700026315 ANNABELLE CUVEE BLANCH CAN (24 X 250ML) L24273 BB30 60 0
700025396 HOOCH BLAST BLACK CURRANT CAN 440ML L24233 8B31 180 0
700025396 HOOCH BLAST BLACK CURRANT CAN 440ML L24229 BB31 90 0
736.00 0.00
Total QTY Received 736,00 0.00
Checked By: N OP_\L‘Q P Receiver: JBK 279 FS
Transpert Company: LE. ek HRCKY

Driver Signature: &\EW&( Lé?r
20/11/2024  08:37:41 AM , .




> Customer Order Data:

Customer Crder Number:
08.11.2024

ESTABLISHED 1918 KWV Order Number:

Warshay [nvestments Pty Ltd t/a KWy |110966567
PO Box 528, Suider mmmﬂw 7646 |Loading Status:
Telephone: 021 - 8073411

Req, No. g ma%ump\co .8 muu\oq
at Q H .
M.»PHW E: FLO-ID 28503 Gross ED_wrﬁ < Q-L.Qm.mmo_nﬂ

OR queriessadkwv.co.za

Prie Tota

901405 qooommwpp Bug Blue Shooter 10(15x20ml} 150 x 20 63.0 |1,550.00 5.20 H hmm 40 $2,572.20 13885.83 106458.03

901406 |700025945 | Bug Red Shooter 10(15x20ml) 150 x 20 63.0 |1,550.00 5.20 T 1,469.40 92,572.,20 12885.83 106458.03
901433 |700025396 | Eooch Blaat Black Currant 4(6x440ml b 24 x 440 |360.0 ~368.76 13.5¢ 318.38 114831.86 17224.77 132056.63
901476 |700026112 | KWV Brandy and Cola 4({6x440ml) 24 x 440 0.0 434.40 7.60 401.39 36,124.70 5,418.71 41,543.41
901444 700026198 | Annabelle Cuvee Rose Petillant 4(6x | c5 24 >x 250 |100.0 320.64 10.5¢0 286.97 28,697.28 4,204.59 33,001.87
901465 |700026315 | Annabelle Cuvee Blanc Petlllant 4(6 | C .EOU 24 x 250 0.0 320.64 19.50 286.97 17,218.37 2,582,786 . 15,801.13

ORDHR NUMBER:

=

) .\N SEAL NUMBERS:

DESPATCH CLERK 3 IGNATURE:

k
@
]
N
|
o
b
[l

Daniageg

Delivered by Received in good order Depot Signature Payment Terms: Bank Details: Chegue Acc
i _ Name: Warshay Investmenta (Pty) Ltd
KWV Local ﬂwunﬁ_..dnw.n_.on. on behalf of Customer m.o._... Receipt from Customer End nxt mth inv before 25th Bank:
£ L B
Name: _ W\ nNFﬂJ Hame: Aol Currency: ZAR Acc: 6300 328 6845
Signature: Signature: Branch: 250655
Paarl Date: E Date:

&~ ~2eny



.

Customer Order Date:

Customar Order Number:
08.11.2024

ESTABLISHED 1918

KWV Order Number:

PO Box 528, Suider

Telephone:

Warshay Investments 1.m Ltd tfa KWV
aarl
021 - 8073511

Nmmﬁ No. : 2012/018792/07
at Reg No: 411026183
FAIR E: FLO-ID 28502

110966567

7646 |Loading Status:

Gross Waight

7.,473.860kg

.Co.Za

901405
901406
901433
901476
901444
901465

700025944
700025945
700025396
700026112
700026198
700026315

Bug Blue Shooter 10 (15x20ml)
Bug Red Sheoter 10{15x20ml}

Hooch Blast Black Curzant 4(6x440ml

KWV Brandy and Cola 4(6x440ml)
Anpabelle Cuvee Rose Petillant 4({6x
Annabelle Cuvee Blanc Petillant 4(6

cs
cs
cs
cs
cs

150 x 20 63.0 |1,550.00
150 x 2¢ 63,0 |1,550.00
24 x 440 [360.0 368.76
24 x 440 90.0 434.40
24 x 250 |l00.0 320.64
24 = 250 6§0.0 320.64

13.50 318.98
7.60 401.39
10.50 286.97
10.50 286.537

92,572.20
92,572.20
114831.86
36,124.70
28,697.28
17,218.37

13885.83
13885.83
17224.77
5,418.71
4,304.59
2,582.76

NUMBER:
JMBERS:

106458.03

CH CLERK S1¢

106458.03
132056.63
41,543.41
33,001.87
19,801.13

ENATURE:

o

NS t ng

Delivered by Received in good erder Depot Signature Payment Terme: Bank Details: Chegque Acc
- Name: Warshay Inveatments (Pty) Ltd
KWV Local. distribution on behalf of Customer For Receipt from Customer End nxt mth inv before 25th Bank:
FNB

Name: EO;OJ zgm"N\%\r‘N\m. Currency: 2AR Rcc: 6300 328 6845

Signature: Signature: Branch: 250655
Paarl Date: : Date: |

S~ )~y /2o .

- ———



Thuli Mbele

R S S
From: Nokwazi Mbuyane <mbuyanen®kwv.co.za>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 11:15
To: Thuli Mbele
Subject: FW: RETURNED STOCK FROM ULTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM - GRV 13326

TEL: +27 12 010 3142

i ZOwAE).N_ g wC/_\)Z m EMAIL: mbuyanen@kwv.co.za

MOBILE: +27 74 228 1983

o
F#NG) = ORINK RESPONSIBLY. NOT FOR PERSONS UNDER THE AGE GF 18.

Warshay Investments (Pty) Ltd (“KWV")

From: James Reade-Jahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.co.za>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 09:50

To: Heinrich Veer <heinrich@lrsa.co.za>; Rowen Smith <rowen@lrsa.co.za>; donovan@Irsa.co.za

Cc: Bornatius Schroeder <schroederb@kwv.co.za>; Charl <Charl@Irsa.co.za>; Marianne Winkelman <winkelmanm@kwv.co.za>; Nokwazi Mbuyane
<mbuyanen@kwv.co.za>; Eugene Roux <rouxe @kwv.co.za>; Sune Groenewald <GroenewaldS@kwv.co.za>

Subject: RE: RETURNED STOCK FROM ULTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM - GRV 13326

Hi Primary team



The Ultra Liguors Bedelia order that was brought to LR JHB, would it be possible to deliver this to Welkom sometime this week?
The store incorrectly rejected the order.

Regards

James Reade-Jahn

From: Nokwazi Mbuyane

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 09:48

To: James Reade-Jahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.co.za>; Eugene Roux <rouxe@kwv.co.za>; Sune Groenewald <GroenewaldS@kwv.co.za>
Cc: Bornatius Schroeder <schroederb@kwv.co.za>; Charl <Charl@lrsa.co.za>; Marianne Winkelman <winkelmanm@kwv.co.za>
Subject: RE: RETURNED STOCK FROM ULTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM - GRV 13326

Good day
We do not deliver to Welkom

Regards
Nokwazi

From: James Reade-Jahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.cg.za>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 09:36

To: Nokwazi Mbuyane <mbuyanen@kwv.co.za>; Eugene Roux <rouxe @kwv.co.za>; Sune Groenewald <GroenewaldS@kwv.co.za>»
Cc: Bornatius Schroeder <schroederb@kwv.co.za>; Charl <Charl@lrsa.ce.za>; Marianne Winkelman <winkeimanm@kwv.cc.za>
Subject: RE: RETURNED STOCK FROM ULTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM - GRV 13326

Hi Nokwazi

This order was incorrectly rejected by the store and they have requested for it to be re delivered if possible?
Ptease advise if you could assist us with this delivery?

Regards

James Reade-jahn

From: Nokwazi Mbuyane
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 08:46



To: Eugene Roux <rouxe@kwv.co.za>; Sune Groenewald <GroenewaldS @kwv.co.za>; James Reade-Jahn <reade-jahnj@kwv.co.za»
Cc: Bornatius Schroeder <schroederb@kwv.co.za>

Subject: RETURNED STOCK FROM ULTRA LIQUORS BEDELIA WELKOM - GRV 13326

Good morning

Please see attached GRV and forward STO to book in stock.

g NOKWAZI MBUYANE  fuail” mouinenios cozs

Warshay Investments (Peay Ld CRKWY™)




